
AGENDA 
Municipai Servkes Committee 

May 23, 2016 

1. Call to Order & Roll Call 

2. Establishment of Quorum 

3. New Business 

a. 

b. 

c. 

d. 

e. 

f. 

g. 

h. 

i. 

j. 

Resolution - Approval of a resolution accepting a proposal from Associated 
Technical Services (ATS) for the 2016 Water Leak Survey, in the amount of 
$9A72.32 for the Leak Detection Phase and a per unit cost for the Lea.le Location 
Phase in the amount of $395.00 per mainline or service leak, and $95.00 per fire 
hydrant leak 

Resolution - Approval of a resolution accepting a proposal from Superior Road 
Striping in an amount not to exceed $13,000.00 

Resolution - Approval of a resolution to enter into a contract agreement with 
Compass Materials for the purchase of rock salt in an amount not to exceed 
$172,883.21 

Resolution - Approval of a resolution to execute an Intergovernmental 
Agreement with Center Cass School District #66 for the reimbursement of Rock 
Salt through the City's 2016/2017 Rock Salt Agreement 

Resolution - Approval of a resolution to execute an Intergovernmental 
Agreement with the Darien Park District for the reimbursement of Rock Salt 
through the City's 2016/2017 Rock Salt Agreement 

PZC 2016-02: 7217 Eleanor Place: Petitioner seeks approval of a variation to 
reduce the required front yard setback from 35 feet to 27 feet to construct a 
covered front porch 

PZC 2016-03: 7730 Brookhaven Avenue: Petitioner seeks approval of a 
variation to reduce the required front yard setback from 35 feet to 25 feet in order 
to construct a covered front porch 

PZC 2016-04: 2310 Green Valley Road: Petitioner seeks approval of a variation 
to reduce the required rear yard setback for decks and patios from 20 feet to 1 7 
feet in order to construct a patio 

PZC 2016-05: 702 Plainfield Road: Petitioner seeks approval of a variation to 
reduce the required rear yard setback from 40 feet to 38.5 feet in order to 
construct a new single-family residence, the new home will face Western Avenue, 
the rear yard will be on the west side of the lot 

Minutes -April 27, 2016 Municipal Services Committee 
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4. Director's Report 

5. Next scheduled meeting- June 27, 2016 

6. Adjournment 
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