AGENDA
Municipal Services Committee
October 22, 2012
6:30 P.M. — Council Chambers

1. Call to Order & Roll Call
2. Establishment of Quorum

3. New Business

a. Ordinance — Petitioner seeks a variation to reduce the required setback
from a side lot line from 5 feet to zero feet for a detached accessory
structure

b. Discussion — Proposed adoption of updated editions model building codes

c. Resolution — Accepting a proposal from Rag’s Electric in an amount not to
exceed $28,200.00 for the Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping at Plant
3-1930 Manning Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road and Plant 5-8700
block of Lemont Road

d. Resolution — To enter into a contact agreement with Homer Tree Care, Inc.
in an amount not to exceed $94,000.00 for the City’s Tree Trimming and
Removal program

e. Resolution — Accepting a proposal from All Star Maintenance Incorporated
to provide snow plowing and deicing services for the parking lot and
walkways at the Darien Heritage Center and the sidewalk plowing and
deicing services at the Municipal Complex as per the unit prices

f. Minutes - September 24, 2012 — Municipal Services Committee

4. Director’s Report
5. Next scheduled meeting — Monday, November 26, 2012.

6. Adjournment



AGENDA MEMO

PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

Issue Statement

PZC 2012-13:

Applicable Regulations:

General Information

Petitioner/
Property Owner:

Property Location:
PIN:
Existing Zoning:

Existing Land Use:

MEETING DATE: October 22, 2012

1406 Plainfield Road: Petitioner seeks a variation to reduce the
required setback from a side lot line from 5 feet to zero feet for a
detached accessory structure.

Zoning Ordinance, Section 5A-5-9-2(A): Location and Yard

Regulations of Accessory Buildings, Structures and Uses of
Land.

Zoning Ordinance, Section 5A-2-2-3: Variations.

Eva Zanayed

1406 Plainfield Road

Darien, IL 60561

1406 Plainfield Road
(09-28-404-035

R-2 Single-Family Residence

Single-family home

Surrounding Zoning and Land Use:

North: R-2 Single-Family Residence - single-family homes
South: R-2 Single-Family Residence — single-family homes
East: R-2 Single-Family Residence — single-family homes
West: R-2 Single-Family Residence - single-family homes

Comprehensive Plan Update: Low Density Residential

History:

In 2010, the City Council granted a variation to permit a

detached accessory structure, a garage, within an interior side yard, and
to reduce the required rear yard setback from 30 feet to 14.7 feet for an
addition.

This variation petition is related to a code enforcement case. The




Agenda Memo
PZC 2012-13: 1406 Plainfield Road

Page 2
petitioner constructed the shed without obtaining a building permit in
2010. The shed is not located on the property in compliance with the
Zoning Ordinance. A must appear in court ticket has been issued and
this petition is part of the effort by the petitioner to resolve the matter.

Property: 13,291 square feet

Floodplain: None.

Natural Features: None.

‘Transportation: Property has frontage on Plainfield Road.

Documents Submitied

This report is based on the following information submitted to the Community Development
Department by the petitioner:

1. Plat of Survey, 1 sheet, prepared by Glen D. Krish Land Survey, Inc., dated August 2, 2010.

Planning Overview/ Discussion

The subject property is located on the north side of Plainfield Road, west of Adams Street.

In 2010, the petitioner constructed a shed on the east side of the subject property without obtaining a
building permit. The shed is not located on the property in compliance with the Zoning Ordinance.
Per the Zoning Ordinance, detached accessory structures, sheds and garages for example, are to be
located at least 5 feet from a side and rear lot lines. The shed in question is located within inches
away from the side lot line. The petitioner is seeking a variation to bring the shed into compliance,

The subject lot is not as deep as is the typical lot in Darien. Therefore, the rear yard is not as deep as
the typical lot in Darien. The Zoning Ordinance does not permit accessory structures to be located
within front and side yards. Therefore, the lot dimensions create challenges when applying the
Zoning Ordinance when locating buildings and structures on the lot, including accessory structures.

This is a pending code enforcement case. This matter is in Court. Despite repeated written notices,
the petitioner failed to either remove the shed or obtain a building permit,

Other code enforcement cases have been resolved, including the petitioner constructing a room
addition o the home without a building permit and constructing a fence within the front yard without
a permit.

There is a second shed located on the west side of the lot, also within the 5-foot setback, withina 10-
foot utility easement and within a side yard. However, generally speaking, staff does not go after




Agenda Memo
PZC 2012-13: 1406 Plainfield Road
Page 3

sheds and other accessory structures which do not comply with the Zoning Ordinance unless staff
witnesses the construction activity and/or a complaint is received.

The variation request must address the following criteria for approval:

1. Whether the general character of the property will be adversely altered.

2. Whether the overall value of the property will be improved and there will not be any
potential adverse effects on the neighboring properties.

3. Whether the alleged need for the variation has been created by any person presently
having a proprietary interest in the premises.

4, Whether the proposed variation will impair an adequate supply of light and air in
adjacent property, substantially increase congestion in the public streets, increase the
danger of fire or endanger the public safety.

5. Whether the proposed variation will adversely alter the essential character of the
neighborhood.

Staff Findings/Recommendations

This lot is unique, it does not have the lot depth typical of most lots within Darien, nor does it meet
the required minimum lot depth of 120 feet under the R-2 zoning district regulations (the subdivision
was recorded in 1956, prior to the City’s existence.) Therefore, the rear yard is such that it is a
challenge to locate a detached accessory structure and comply with building setbacks.

Therefore, staff recommends the Planning and Zoning Commission make the following
recommendation granting the variation petition:

Based upon the submitted petition and the information presented, the request
associated with PZC 2012-13 is in conformance with the standards of the Darien City
Code and, therefore, I move the Planning and Zoning Commission recommend
approval of the petition.

Planning and Zoning Commission Review October 3, 2012

The Planning and Zoning Commission considered this item at its meeting on October 3, 2012. The
following members were present: Beverly Meyer — Chairperson, Donald Hickok, Ronald Kiefer,
John Lind, Raymond Mielkus, Michael Griffith — Senior Planner and Elizabeth Lahey — Secretary.
Members absent: Louis Mallers, Pauline Oberland, Kenneth Ritzert and Susan Vonder Heide.
Michael Griffith, Senior Planner, reviewed the staff agenda memo.

Tony and Eva Caruso, 1406 Plainfield Road, Darien, Illinois, were present. They explained that the
shed originally was intended to be temporary only. They explained that they could not remove the

shed since they have since constructed a garage on the property.

Commissioner Hickok asked the petitioners how they ended up in Court.




Agenda Memo
PZC 2012-13: 1406 Plainfield Road
Page 4

Tony Caruso stated they tried to work with the City on resolving the matter but the City went ahead
and issued a ticket.

Mr. Griffith stated that several written notices were sent concerning the shed and the petitioners did
not bring the matter into compliance.

There was not anyone from the public to offer any comments.

Without further discussion, Commissioner Kiefer made the following motion, seconded
by Commissioner Mielkus:

Based upon the submitted petition and the information presented, the request
associated with PZC 2012-13 is in conformance with the standards of the Darien City
Code and, therefore, I move the Planning and Zoning Commission recommend
approval of the petition.

Decision Mode

The Planning/Zoning Commission considered this item at its meeting on October 3, 2012.
The Municipal Services Committee will consider this item at its meeting on October 22, 2012.

UADCD\PLANNING & ZONING COMMPZC CASES I-P\Phinfield Rd 1406.PZC 2012-13\MEMO. 1406 Phirfield Rd.msc.doc




] o 2 e

SEE <4

| BPLAY OF SURVEY st

3 7 107 287 IV BROOKHAVEN WANDR, A choln 6t 7 mEm—

] I\, SUBDIUSION N SEGTCNS 27 AND 28, liaayl &g Ve ’
£ TOWNSHIP (38 NORTH, RANGE 11 EAST OF THE [ )
:ir‘?i THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN,
L ACCORQING TO THE PLAT THEREOF RECORDED B R

al (ot Comer

DELEMBER 6, Y956 AS DOCUMENT B27287, 1N
DUPAGE COUNTY, (LLINGIS,

] RS LR
&

i

PROPERTY DESCRIBED CONTAINS 13,281 .1,

BA - PARCEL NO. DS-28-404-035
m o i Lat
3 : w7
7
? 3 i
L -
oo
& g
Eil%
L

[ AP,

B b R LD SR e T R et ey,

et |5 | 30-Port rear yardy
Hi . lg’ g .I :_;;-}-‘:utﬁ I-.I-'h'P b
ISR A

‘, l

diempnt

‘.E-‘

%

RS B S S T

5

Tt ]

5%

o

PoE
-
R -4
. Ml
: Uy
! vl B

4
e %
STATE, OF NUNDIS )
COuWtY OF DRPAGE ) 5.5

{Hi5 PROFESSIONAL SEAVICE CONFORMS TO CURRENT ILLINOIS WINIUK
STANGAADS FOR & BOUNDARY SURAVEY THAT 1, MICHAEL 1. HRISCH, &N
fLUWOIE FAOFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYLN, HAVE HAD SURVEYED UNDEd UY
SUPERVSIGN THE AROPEATY DESCAIHED IN THE ABOVE CARTIDN AS SHOWM BY
THE &MHEYED-BLAT WHICH IS & REPAESEMTATION COF 341D SURVEY,

LA i g i
f{CWge Rreread NG BURVE YA
.33~ 2500 LY 13 /30/2010

~
‘REFER vO DEEL OR ‘GUARANTEE POLICY FOR BUILDING LIME AESTRIGTIONS AKD
EASEMENTS (I SHOWN DM PLAT OF SURVEY, COWPARE DESCRIRTION AND . .{ IN FEBT }
EOniTS BEFHAE BUILDING AND REPORT ANY APPARENT DIFFERENCE 0 THE ‘1 ineh = 20 It
CGURVEYDR A¥ONCE: THIS SURVEY AND PLAT OF SURVEY ARE VOID waATHOUT ne

PR EuBNSEED SURVEYOR SEAL HEREON, WO DIMENSIONS ARE 70 BE ASSUNED
IBY SCaLG;

i

Prapared Far: EVA ZAMAYE

GLEN D. KRISCH LAND SURVEYOR,

PROFESSIONAL DESIGN FIRM UCENSE No. 184—G04233

p.0..B0% 828 « FLAINFELD, L 50544 +  Phoner 530,627.5
Fox: 630.618.3

SURVEYING - CONSULTING « CONSTRUCTION LAY

ot in Trio o taclaniitm—n lean St 1A1na

o (Y = 3




AGENDA MEMO
MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE
MEETING DATE: Oectober 22, 2012

Issue Statement

Building Codes: Discussion on proposed adoption of updated editions model building codes.

Planning Overview/ Discussion

Working with the City’s consultant, Don Morris Architects P.C., which provides Darien with
building plan reviews and building inspections, staff has reviewed the 2012 edition of model
building codes and the 2011 edition of the electrical code. The following table notes the current and

proposed codes:

Current Codes

Proposed Codes

2006 International Residential Code (One and
Two-Family Dwellings)

2012 International Residential Code (One and
Two-Family Dwellings)

2006 International Building Code (Commercial,
Multi-Family Residential Dwellings)

2012 International Building Code (Commercial,
Multi-Family Residential Dwellings)

2006 International Mechanical Code

2012 International Mechanical Code

2005 National Fire Protection Association
National Electrical Code (aka, Electrical Code)

2011 National Fire Protection Association
National Electrical Code (aka, Electrical Code)

2004 Hlinois State Plumbing Code

2004 Tllinois State Plumbing Code

2006 International Fire Code

2012 International Fire Code

2006 International Property Maintenance Code

2012 International Property Maintenance Code

Concerning the Illinois State Plumbing Code, there has not been an update.

Concerning the Building Code, a significant change includes taking out local amendments providing
exceptions on when fire sprinklers where required and going with the model code requirements. The
local amendments were creating more problems than benefits when applying the code to alterations
of existing commercial/office/industrial buildings.

Concerning the model Residential Code, a significant change includes requiring new single-family
detached homes to be fire sprinkled. The draft ordinance includes a local amendment removing this




Agenda Memo
Building Codes, 2012 Edition
Page 2

requirement.

While the core building standards and practices have not changed much in the past 20 years, it is
important to periodically review the standards, because there is always the need to clarify language
and to acknowledge new technologies.

The Fire Districts serving Darien have been notified of the proposed model codes as well as the
proposed local amendments. Staff asked each of the Districts to review specifically the proposed
Fire Code and local amendments.

A draft copy of the changes to Title 4 of the City Code is attached. The revised Title 4 adopts each

of the above codes by reference and adopts amendments to several of the model codes per the
recommendations of the City’s architect/building inspection consultants and Fire Districts.

Staff Findings/Recommendations

This item is for discussion only.

Municipal Services Committee — October 22, 2012

Changes to the draft ordinance have been noted with either language to be stricken (strieken) or with
new language in red (red). Brief explanations to these changes are noted in italics (italics). Staff
proposes adopting one additional model code, the 2012 International Energy Conservation Code,
noted below in the revised table.

Current Codes Proposed Codes

2006 International Residential Code (One and
Two-Family Dwellings)

2012 International Residential Code (One and
Two-Family Dwellings)

2006 International Building Code (Commercial,
Multi-Family Residential Dwellings)

2012 International Building Code (Commercial,
Muiti-Family Residential Dwellings)

2006 International Mechanical Code 2012 International Mechanical Code

2005 National Fire Protection Association
National Electrical Code (aka, Electrical Code)

2011 National Fire Protection Association
National Electrical Code (aka, Elecirical Code)

2004 Illinois State Piumbing Code

2004 Ilinois State Plumbing Code




Agenda Memo
Building Codes, 2012 Edition
Page 3

2006 International Fire Code

2012 International Fire Code

2006 International Property Maintenance Code

2012 International Property Maintenance Code

2012 International Energy Conservation Code

Staff Findings/Recommendations

This item is for discussion only.

Decision Mode

The Municipal Services Committee considered this item at its meeting on September 24, 2012.
The Municipal Services Committee will consider this item at its meeting on October 22, 2012.

UADCINCODE ISSUES & DISCUSSIONS\BUILDING CODES 2012 EDITIONWEMO. Building Code 2012 ed.msc.2.doc




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 1...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

BUILDING REGULATIONS
DARIEN BUILDING CODE
4-1-1: TITLE, CITATIONS AND SUBSTITUTIONS:
4-1-1-1; TITLE:
This chapter shall be known as the DARIEN BUILDING CODEF.
4-1-1-2: CITATIONS:

In citing this chapter, section numbers shall be used except in cases where codes have been
adopted and incorporated by reference, in which case the section shall be followed by sections
used in such code adopted and incorporated by reference.

4-1-1-3: SUBSTITUTIONS:

Where codes have been adopted and incorporated by reference, the words "city of Darien"
shall be substituted for words referring to the applicable municipality and where such codes
contain pravisions which are in conflict with specific provisions of this chapter the specific
provisions of this chapter shall prevail and shall rule.

4-1-2: GENERAL PROVISIONS:
4-1-2-1: ESTABLISHMENT OF THE DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT:

{A} There is hereby established a department of the city known as the department of
community development which shali embrace a director of community development, senior
planner and such assistants, clerks and employees as may be necessary.

{B) All references in this code, the building code, the zoning ordinance, the sign code, the
subdivision regulations, the fire prevention code, and in all other ordinances, resolutions and
motions, and rules and regulations of the city to the "building department", the "building and
zoning department”, the "bureau of fire prevention", shall henceforth be construed to refer to
and mean the department of community development.

4-1-2-2: DIRECTOR OF COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT:

(A) The director of community development shall be appointed by the mayor with the advice
and consent of the city council and subject to removal by the mayor. The director shall be in




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 2...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

charge of the department of community development and shall institute such measures and
prescribe such rules and regulations for the control of subordinate officers and employees and
shall secure the inspection of buildings while in the process of construction, alteration, repair or
removal, and enforcement of all provisions of the building code.

The director of community development is hereby authorized to employ, by and with the
consent of the city administrator, such inspectors or assistants as may be necessary in the
execution of the duties mentioned in the building code or other ordinances as may be from
time to time required.

The director of community development is hereby authorized to require as a condition to an
application and issuance of a permit that the applicant pay fees in addition to those otherwise
provided herein of review by other than staff members of plans and specifications.

(B) The duties of the director of community development shall include, but are not limited to,
all of the duties of the building department supervisor, the building official, the director of
building and zoning, the fire official, the code official, the fire marshal, the chief of the bureau
of fire prevention, the zoning enforcement officer, the building commissioner, the city planner,
the building inspector, the building and zoning director and the building supervisor as set forth
in this code, in the building code, in the zoning ordinance, in the sign code, in the subdivision
regulations, in the fire prevention code, and in all other ordinances, resolutions and motions,
and rules and regulations of the city.

All references in this code, the building code, the zoning ordinance, the sign code, the
subdivision regulations, the fire prevention code, and in all other ordinances, resolutions and
motions, and rules and regulations of the city to the "building departiment supervisor”, the
"building official", the "director of building and zoning", the "fire official", the "code official",
the "fire marshal", the "chief of the bureau of fire prevention", the "zoning enforcement
officer", the "building commissioner"”, the "city planner", the "building inspector”, the "building
and zoning director” and the "building supervisor" shall henceforth be construed to refer to and
mean the director of community development.

4-1-3: SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS, DUPLEXES AND TWO-FLAT BUILDING CONSTRUCTION
REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS:

4-1-3-1: ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE:
There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as a part of this section, the code

entitled "20806 2012 international residential code", three (3) copies of which are on file in the
office of the city.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 3...Draft: Updated Qctober 18, 2012

4-1-3-2: AMENDMENTS TO CODE:

The 2006 2012 international residential code, as adopted in section 4-1-3-1 of this chapter shall
be amended as follows:

{A} Section R-101.1 - Insert the "City of Darien" for [name of jurisdiction].
{B) Section R-108.2 - Revise to read as follows:

See City code of Darien for appropriate fee schedules.

(C) Section R-113.4 - Revise to read as follows:

Violation penalties: See the City code of Darien for penalties for violations of the provisions of
this code.

(D) Section R-302.1 and Table R302.1(1) — Delete (Exterior Walls)
“Exterior Walls” deals with a required fire rating of a buildings exterior wall based on its
setback from lot lines. This is a commercial requirement and will have a negative impact
on detached accessory buildings, i.e., sheds and detached garages.

(E) Section R-309 - Revise to read as follows:

R-309-9- A ducted cold air return is required in every sleeping room.

(F) Section R-313 — Delete. {(Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems)
The City of Darien has approximately 15 available open lots to build on. Also, given that
fire sprinklers cost approximately 53.00 per square foot and do not substantially lower
homeowners insurance rates, staff recommends deleting this requirement.

(G) Section R-320 — Delete. {Accessibility)
This section deals with handicapped accessibility. The 1997 illinois Handicap
Accessibility Code is a State mandated code. Therefore, Section R-320 is not applicable.

(H) Section R-321 — Delete. (Elevators and Platform Lifts)

{1} Section R-322.1.9 — Delete. {Manufactured Homes)

{J) Section R-403.1 — Revise to add the following:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 4...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

Pier footings are acceptable for open porches only and not acceptable for screened-in porches,
3-season rooms or suUNFgoms.

(K) Section R-403.2 — Delete. (Footings for Wood Foundations)
Woad foundations are not permitted in this Climate Zone.

(L) Sections R-403.3 through R-403.3.4 - Delete. {Frost Protected Shallow Foundations)
Wood foundations are not permitted in this Climate Zone.

(M) Sections R-404.2 through R-404.4.11 — Delete all sections and tables in their entirety.
(Wood Foundation Walls)
Wood foundations are not permitted in this Climate Zone.

(N) Section R-405.2 ~ Delete. (Wood Foundations)
Wood foundations are not permitted in this Climate Zone.

(O) Section R-406.3 — Delete. {(Dampproofing for Wood Foundations)
Wood foundations are not permitted in this Climate Zone.

(P) Section R-1006.1 - Revise to read as follows:

R-1006-1- Exterior Air: Factory-built or masonry fireplaces cavered in this chapter shall be
equipped with an exterior air supply to assure proper fuel combustion unless the room is
mechanically ventilated and controlled so that the indoor pressure is neutral or positive,
Ventless or vent-free fireplaces are prohibited.

(Q) Chapter 25 — Delete. {Plumbing Administration)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 Illinois Plumbing
Code.

(R) Chapter 26 - Delete. (General Plumbing Requirements)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lllinois Plumbing
Code.

{S) Chapter 27 - Delete. (Plumbing Fixtures)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 llinois Plumbing
Code.

{T) Chapter 28 - Delete. {Water Heaters)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lllinois Plumbing
Code.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 5...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

{U) Chapter 29 - Delete. (Water Supply And Distribution)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lllinois Plumbing
Code.

{V) Chapter 30 - Delete. (Sanitary Drainage)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lilinois Plumbing
Code.

(W) Chapter 31 - Delete. (Vents)

Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 ilfinois Plumbing
Code.

(X) Chapter 32 - Delete. (Traps)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 Hllinois Plumbing
Code.

(Y) Chapter 33 - Delete. {General-Reguirements) (Storm Drainage)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lilinois Plumbing
Code.

(Z) Chapter 34 - Delete. {Electrical Befinitions} (General Requirements)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lilinois Plumbing
Code.

(AA) Chapter 35 - Delete. {Serviees) (Electrical Definitions)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lllinois Plumbing
Code.

(BB) Chapter 36 - Delete. {Branch-Circuit- And-FeederReguirements} (Services)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 Hlinois Plumbing
Code.

{CC) Chapter 37 - Delete. {MiringMethods) (Branch Circuit and Feeder Requirements}
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 Hiinois Plumbing
Code.

(DD) Chapter 38 - Delete. {Power-And-ighting-Distribution} (Wiring Methods)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lfinais Plumbing
Code.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 6...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

{(EE) Chapter 39 - Delete. {Devices-And-tuminaries) (Power and Lighting Distribution)
(FF) Chapter 40 - Delete. {Appliancednstallation} (Devices and Luminaries)

Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 lilinois Plumbing
Code.

(GG} Chapter 41 - Delete. {SwimmingPools} (Appliance Installation)
Chapters 25-41 are covered in the National Electrical Code and the 2004 Hilinois Plumbing

Code.

(HH) Chapter 42 - Delete. {Class2-Remete Control-Signaling-And Power-Limited Circuits)

(Swimming Pools)
(It) Chapter 43 — Delete. (Class Remote Control Signaling and Power Limited Circuits)
(1)) Chapter 44 — Delete. (Referenced Standards)

(KK) 2886 2012 International Residential Code Electrical Provisions/National Code Cross
Reference (appendix Q) - Delete.

Agricultural exception: Accessory buildings on existing, legal nonconforming agricultural
properties that are utilized as stables and livestock shelters, where no vehicle storage will take
place will be allowed in accordance with the following requirements:

1. Required concrete floor slabs may be omitted in those specific areas of livestock
buildings or structures used by the livestock upon approval of the director of
community development.

2. Other than in subsection {X}1 of this section, floors shall be concrete, asphalt or
wood installed to prevent the seepage of hazardous, toxic or combustible liquids
into the ground.

3 All accessory buildings shall be securely anchored to the ground.

4. Preengineered accessory building kits shall be installed in accordance with
manufacturer's specifications and plans.

4-1-3-3: APPLICATION TO BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 7...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

The rules and regulations adopted in section 4-1-3-1 of this chapter shall apply to the following
buildings and structures:

{A) Single-family detached residences.

(B) Duplex houses (2 units side by side) and two-family apartments or flats.

(C) Detached accessory structures.

4-1-4: REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS FOR CONSTRUCTION OF ALL OTHER BUILDINGS
INCLUDING RESIDENTIAL (OTHER THAN ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY), ASSEMBLY, COMMERCIAL,
OFFICE, STORAGE, EDUCATIONAL, INDUSTRIAL AND INSTITUTIONAL:

4-1-4-1: ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE:

There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled
the "2006 2012 international building code”, three {3) copies of which are on file in the office of
the city.

4-1-4-2: AMENDMENTS TC CODE:

The 2006 2012 international building code, as adopted in section 4-1-4-1 of this chapter shall be
amended as follows:

{A) Section 101.1 - Insert the "city of Darien" for [name of jurisdiction].
(B} Section 1082 109.2 - Revise to read as follows:

109.2 - See city code of Darien for appropriate fee schedules.

(C) Section 113.4 114.4 - Revise to read as follows:

114.4 - Violation penalties: See city code of Darien for penalties for violations of the provisions
of this code.

{D} Section 1343 117.2 - Revise to read as follows:

117.2 - Afine of not less than $100.00 or more than $1,000.00 for each day the above violation
shall be imposed.




BLUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 8...Draft; Updated Octoher 18, 2012

- afala -— ' adala’ - - -] - aalalsda

The 2012 International Building Code (1BC) does not need further sprinkling
requirements. Table 503 and Chapter 9 of the 2012 IBC provide sufficient sprinkling
requirements.

4-1-4-3: APPLICATION TO BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES:
The building code adopted in section 4-1-4-1 of this chapter shall apply to all buildings and

structures other than one- and two-family residences and other buildings normally accessory to
them.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 9...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

4-1-5: REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS GOVERNING THE CONSTRUCTION AND USE OF
MECHANICAL EQUIPMENT:

4-1-5-1: ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE:

There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled
"2006 2012 international mechanical code", three (3} copies of which are on file in the office of
the city.

4-1-5-2: AMENDMENTS TO MECHANICAL CODE:

The 2006 2012 international mechanical code as adopted in section 4-1-5-1 of this chapter shall
be amended as follows:

(A) Insert "the city of Darien" wherever the code refers to jurisdiction.

(B) Wherever fee schedules, dollar amounts, offenses, or time [imits are referred to in this code,
the code of the city of Darien shall apply.

(C) Section 927 — Add the following:
Section 927 - Ventless and vent free fireplaces are prohibited.

4-1-5-3: ADOPTION OF SAFETY CODE FOR EXISTING ELEVATORS AND ESCALATORS {"ELEVATOR
CODE"):

There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled
"safety code for existing elevators and escalators, 2005 edition", by the American Society of
Mechanical Engineers, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the city.

4-1-5-4: AMENDMENTS TO ELEVATOR CODE:

The safety code for existing elevators and escalators, as adopted in section 4-1-5-3 of this
chapter shall be amended to read as follows:

{A) Insert the "city of Darien" wherever the code refers to jurisdiction.
{B) Section 1.4: Definitions - Revise to read as follows:

Building Code: The 20806 2012 international building code, and as amended by section 4-1-4-2
of this chapter.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 10...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

4-1-6: STANDARDS AND SPECIFICATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE NATIONAL
ELECTRICAL CODE:

4-1-6-1: ADOPTION OF NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION NATIONAL ELECTRICAL
CODE;

The standards and specifications, rules and regulations of the National Fire Protection
Association national electrical code, 2605 2011 edition, as published by the National Fire
Protection Association except as amended herein, are hereby adopted as the standards and
specifications, rules and regulations for installation, alteration, repair and use of electrical
equipment, subject however, to the additional standards and specifications, rules and
regulations as hereinafter set forth, and except where they are in conflict with the other
provisions of this code and said code is hereby incorporated herein by reference.

4-1-7: PLUMBING INSTALLATION, ALTERATION AND USE REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS:
4-1-7-1: ADOPTION OF THE PLUMBING CODE OF THE STATE OF ILLINOIS:
There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled

“Hllinois state plumbing cade 2004 edition®, three (3} copies of which are on file in the office of
the city.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 11..Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

4-1-7-2: ADDITIONS TO CODE:

Additions to the lllinois state plumbing code, as adopted in section 4-1-7-1 of this chapter, are
as follows:

(A} The installation of water conserving plumbing fixtures in all new construction and in all
repair and/or replacement of fixtures shall be required according to the following table:

Fixtures - Maximum Flow* -

%
[

Water clos‘éts, tank top . 2.5 gals per flush :

30 ga;S per"ﬂush

3.0 gai‘;‘kper flush

Water closets, flushometer type

ml“Jrina!s, tank type

Urin::a[s, flushometer type 30 gals per flush

Shower heads  3.0GPM

Lavatory, sink faucets § 30 GPM

*Note: FIowm}S;"s:ecE on 40 to 50 psi pressu‘;;.wi ’

(B) Closed water systems shall be required on all water using air conditioning systems in new
construction or remodeling.

(C) Metering or self-closing faucets shall be required on all lavatories for public use in new
construction or remodeling.

(D) Water recycling systems shall be required on all new construction or remodeled car wash
eguipment installations.

4-1-7-3: AMENDMENTS TO CODE:

The Illinois state plumbing code, as adopted in section 4-1-7-1 of this chapter shall be amended
as follows:

{A) Table A - Items 3) and 4) add footnote 3 for type M copper. Type M copper is not permitted
for water distribution systems.

{B) All drain lines must be permitted smaller than four inch (4") diameter material.

4-1-8: FIRE PREVENTION AND CONTROL REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 12...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

4-1-8-1: ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE Q& FHE-BLULDING OFFICIALS AND CODE
ABMHPMSFRATORS HINTERNAHONALANG::

There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled

"2086 2012 international fire code", printed in pamphlet form by-the Building Officials-and
Code-Administrators-tnternationaltneincluding no-errata-sheets-inserted, three (3) copies of

which are on file with the city.
4-1-8-2: AMENDMENTS TO CODE:

The 2006 2012 international fire code, as adopted in section 4-1-8-1 of this chapter shall be
amended as follows:

(A) Section 101.1 - Insert "City of Darien" for [name of jurisdiction].
(B} Section 108 - Revise board of appeals to read:

Whenever the chief of the bureau of fire prevention shall disapprove an application, or refuse
to grant a permit, or when it is claimed that the provisions of this article have been
misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the applicant or person affected may appeal from the
decision of the director of building and zoning to the planning and zoning commission of the
city of Darien. Appeals made pursuant to this section shall be in accordance with the
procedures set forth in the city's zoning ordinance.

{C) Section 503.1 - Revise to read:

Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided so that:

1. Public or private access is provided to each building so that the first responding fire district
pumper unit will be able to be so located that all points of the interior of the building may be
reached by one hundred fifty {150) feet of initial attack hose.

a. Where the size of the building does not allow this regulation to be met, an interior standpipe
system equipped with fire department hose connections approved by the fire official may be

allowed as an exception. The standpipe system shall be connected to a public water system.

2. Public or private access for motor fire apparatus shall be provided around the building so
that there may be proper operation of ladders and mechanically elevated mechanisms.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 13...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

3. Access routes shall be so arranged that fire department apparatus may respond from all
points of the building to adjacent fire hydrants along routes not to exceed two hundred fifty
{250) feet from the most remote point of the building to the closest fire hydrant.

4. Fire lanes on private property shall be approved by the fire official, and parking of motor
vehicles otherwise obstructing such fire lanes or access routes shall be prohibited at all times.
Permanent all-weather signs identifying fire lanes and access ways shall be posted.

5. In commercial developments public or private fire department access roads and ways shall
be all weather, properly maintained and accessible at all times. A minimum of eight (8) inches
of granular stone surfaced by at least two {2) inches of bituminous asphalt material. Fire lanes
in residential developments shall be reviewed by the fire official for adequacy.

6. Access roads or fire lanes shall be not less than fifteen {15) feet from the building and further
if the height of the building requires a greater setback to ladder the buildings.

7. Access routes shall be continuous around the building.

a. This requirement may be modified by the fire official where adequate building access
openings, a complete fire suppression system and high rise provisions are provided.

(D) Add section 316 506 - Revise to read:
Section 316:8 506.0 - Fire Department Rapid Entry System.

Section 336-1 506.1 - General. The fire official shall require all new and existing construction
thatis requured 1o be equped W|th an approved fire a]arm system that-consists-afsmoke
ete or sprinkler

system to have an approved key box system eaeeept—ef—l—and—%—ﬁam+l—y—dweﬂ+ngs—tkuﬁy—(3@-)-days
afterapproval of ordinance:

Section 3362 506.2 - Purpose. The purpose of the rapid entrance key system is to allow the fire
department to gain immediate access to a building in emergency situations without forcible
entry.

Section 316:2 506.3 - Locatron The approved key box shall not be located more than 5 feet
above grade 3 : 3

Section 316-4 506.4 - Contents. The approved key box shall contain key, keycards, etc. as
needed to gain necessary access as required by the code official.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 14...Drafi: Updated October 18, 2012

Section 346:5 506.5 - Alarms. At the request of the owner or lesseg, the fire code official shall
permit him to install a key box tamper switch connected to the building's alarm system. If the
owner or lessee chooses to connect the key box to an alarm, then they shall comply with the
following requirements:

1. If the building is protected by a burglar alarm system, the key box shall be connected to that
system.

2. If the building is not protected by a burglar alarm system, the key box may be connected to
the fire alarm providing the connection is on the trouble side signaling an alarm. Connection to
the fire alarm requires the key box to be zoned separately from any fire detection and noted on
the fire alarm annunciator panel as KEY BOX.

(E) Add section 34Z 319 to read:
Section 317408 319.0 - Miscellaneous Provisions.

Section 34421 319.1 - Hazardous Areas - Room used for storage, boiler or furnace rooms, fuel
storage, janitors' closets, and maintenance shops shall be separated from other building areas
by assemblies having a fire resistance rating of not less than one hour with appropriate
protection of openings into the rooms.

Section 3372 319.2 - Fire Evacuation Procedure Notice. Owners, managers, and agents of
multiple dwelling units with more than six (6) three-{3}ormere units, motels, hotels and places
of assembly, served by a common entrance, shall post and maintain in a conspicuous location
within each dwelling unit and in access routes, a written notice which explains what procedures
to use in the event of a fire. The notice shall contain a diagram of all fire exits.

(F) Add section 338 320 - Packing Materials. Materials used for protective packing shall be kept
in approved noncombustible containers.

Section 348-1 320.1 - Removal Of Packing And Waste Materials. No persons shall store in any
building excess amounts of combustible empty packing cases, wooden or plastic pallets, barrels
boxes, rubber tires, shavings, excelsior, rubbish, paper bags, litter, hay, straw and similar
combustibles. Aisle ways and storage of the abovementioned combustibles necessary for the
performance of business shall be kept in an orderly and neat manner. Combustible materials
shall be removed daily or more often as is necessary to suitable vaults, bins, dumpsters,
compactors or separate buildings. Such practices shall be as approved by the fire official.

L

(G) Section 505.1 - Address Numbers. Delete the word “alphabet.” rthe-third-nefrom-the

H "
7 T




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 15...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(H) Section 806.1.1 - Restricted Occupancies. Revise to read as follows:

Natural cut trees shail only be permitted in the dwelling units of group R-2 and R-3 occupancies.
(I} Section 807.4.3.1 - Storage In Corridors And Lobbies. Delete exceptions 1 and 2.

(J) Section 807.4.4.1 - Storage In Corridors And Lobbies. Delete exceptions 1 and 2.

(K) Add to Sections 901.7-1-and- 90172 to read:

Section 901.7-% - Systems Qut Of Service. Automatic fire suppression systems shall not be out of
service for more than eight (8) hours for additions, alterations, maintenance or repairs without
the approval of the fire official or the designated representative.

This is not reasonable and should be deleted. In most cases the work will be done to the
sprinkler piping itself. The section that might need the water, could in fact not even be
connected to the sprinkler system at the time.

{L) Section 905 - Standpipe Systems. Add the following:

Class | standpipe systems shall be installed in all buildings where any portion of the building's

interior area is more than one hundred fifty (150) twe-hundred-{200)} feet of travel from the
nearest point of fire district vehicle access.

Change made to make this section consistent with section 503.1 of the Fire Code.

{M) Add section 905.12 to read:

Section 905.12 - Standpipe Flow Switch. All standpipe systems shall have flow switches
interconnected to the building fire alarm system.

(N) Section 906.1 - Where Required. Add the following:

7. Within five (5) feet of all exit doors in-all-but group-R-3-eecupancies,and-within-seventy-five
{#5Heetoftraveldistance. If there are practical difficulties in locating the fire extinguisher

within five (5) feet of an exit door, then the fire-extinguisher shall be-located-as-directed-by-the

cade official shall designate an approved location.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 16...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(O) Revise section 907 to read:
Section 867 907.2 - Fire Alarm And Automatic Detection Required.

Section 8873 907.2 - All Other Use Groups Except R-3. In all buildings with floor areas greater
than two thousand (2,000) square feet, automatic and manual fire alarm systems shall be
required and approved by the code official for the particular application and-shall-enbrbe-used
for-detectionand-signalingintheeventoffire. Detection devices shall be compatible with the

hazards and purpose for alarm.
The newer codes allow fire alarm systems to be used for other building emergencies.

Each building which is required to be built pursuant to the 2806 2012 international building
code as adopted by the city of Darien, having a required F.A. system shall be equipped with a
wireless radio connection, approved by the code official, between its automatic fire detection
equipment and such appropriate dispatch station as utilized by the fire protection district or
department which services the structure.

Assembly. Both new and existing educational and institutional use groups shall be equipped
with an approved fire alarm system. This shall include assembly and educational uses with 20 or
more occupants.

Section 907.2 - Alarm systems in use group R-1, R-2 and R-3 {except for detached single-family
dwelling structures) shall comply with the following: Approved automatic fire detection
protection shall be provided to protect new and existing multi-family buildings, which include
apartments of three {3) or more units, townhouses and similar uses.

1. Approved automatic smoke detection devices wired to an activated living unit electrical
circuit shall be provided in the vicinity of all bedrooms and elsewhere, based on room
arrangements, in each living unit.

(a) The wiring shall allow for easy removal and replacement of the device.

{b) Each detector shall include an audible alerting device.

i. Approved fixed temperature devices shall be provided in each living unit near the kitchen and
living room areas, with not less than one installed on each floor level. These shall be part of the
fire alarm system.

ii. Generally unattended areas such as storage rooms, garages, combustible unattended areas,

elevator shafts, furnace rooms, basements, attic spaces, crawl spaces and similar areas shall be
protected by approved heat detection devices.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 17...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

iii. Approved smoke detection devices shall be provided in all public or common egress routes,
including corridors, stairways, exit hallways, etc.

iv. All devices, except living unit smoke detectors (from 1. above), shall be interconnected to an
approved control panel with an audible alerting system servicing all floors of the building.

v. A zone indicator panel shall be provided in any building having multiple living units, with each
zone serving more than one floor.

2. Assembly. Both new and educational and institutional use groups shall be equipped with an
approved fire alarm system.

Section 8843 907.1.4 - Design. The system shall be designed and installed in accordance with
the National Fire Protection Association No. 72, Installation, Maintenance and Use of Protective
Signaling Systems, 2007 2010 edition, with automatic detectors designed and installed in
accordance with the National Fire Protection Association.

Section 3874 907.6.2 - Power Supplies. A primary power supply source for the operation of the
system under normal conditions shall be provided. A secondary power supply for operation of
the system shall be by a U.L. approved energy device or minimum 60-hour storage battery or
engine driven generator.

Section 907.5 - No alarm shall be out of service for more than 24 consecutive hours.

Section 9846 907.2 - Automatic Sprinklers. Where automatic sprinklers provide protection to
an area, approved flow and tamper switches intercannected to the fire alarm system shall be
provided.

Section 9077 907.6.3 - Zones. Each floor and each area over 15,000 square feet in area shall be
separately zoned. Each type of system (sprinkler, halon, alarm, etc.) shall be separately zoned.

Add Section 967-8 907.6.3.3 - Each sprinkler system need only be zoned per floor for a flow
alarm.

Add Section 9648 907.10 - The fire protection district shall have access at any time of the day
or night to the fire alarm control panel without entering an individual living {dwelling) unit. The
fire alarm panel must be installed in an approved climate controlled, weather protected closet
with 24-hour access from the exterior of the building.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 18...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(P) Add section 915 to read:
Section 915 - Fire Hydrant Locations.

Section 915.1 - Fire Hydrant Locations. Water supplies shall be delivered under pressure to fire
hydrants located as follows:

1. Fire hydrants shall be located along public streets, fire lanes, or access routes so that no
portion of the building will be over 250 feet from a public fire hydrant. Where this is not
possible, additional hydrants shall be located on the premises and be accessible to motorized
fire apparatus.

2. In apartments, townhouses, condominiums, town/row or cluster housing areas where streets
or parking lots dead end, hydrants shall be placed along the access route at a location approved
by the fire official.

3. At least two (2) fire hydrants shall be located within 300 feet of the building.

4. Hydrants should be so located that:

a. Hydrants will be located approximately ten (10) feet from all weather roadways. If this
cannot be done, the closest part of the hydrant shall be set back at least two (2) feet from the

curb.

b. Hydrants shall not be located further than 75 feet from any fire department sprinkler or
standpipe connection as determined by the code official.

c. Hydrants shall not be located closer than 25 feet to a building.

d. Hydrant outlets shall be a minimum of 18 inches but not more than 36 inches above the
finished grade.

e. Access to fire hydrants shall be all-weather roadways adequate in width, clearance and
strength for fire fighting purposes. Such routes including private roadways, shall be maintained
accessible during all seasons of the year.

5. Fire hydrants used in conjunction with water supplies shall have two {(2'/,) inch and one
(4%/2) inch outlets with auxiliary gate valves on the hydrant branch line. Threads shall be
American National Standard. Pumper outlets shall face roadways.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 19...0Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

6. Fire hydrants shall be protected from accidental damage by approved methods when located
in areas subject to vehicular damage.

(Q) Section 2086-3 Humination-Emergency-Rower 1006.1.1 Emergency Power for Hlumination -

revise to read as follows:

Emergency lighting shall be equipped with power supplies from an independent, approved
reliable source (battery or automatic starting generator). Emergency lighting shall be provided
in all rooms and spaces over 2,000 square feet in area, or in rooms with an occupancy load of
20 or mare, When required, emergency lighting shall be installed in stairways, corridors, access
routes and other exit components. Multi-family building - emergency lighting will be required in
all existing and new multi-family buildings in stairways, corridars, exit access and other exit
components,

(R) Add section 28084-16 1021.1.1 - Number And Location Of Exits. All rooms or spaces with
accommodations for 20 or more persons or over 2,000 square feet in area and each floor shall
have 2 separate means of egress.

(S} Add section 3388-12 5600.1 - to read:

Section 336812 5600.1 - Bond And Responsibility. Bond and responsibility for fireworks display
and discharge requires "public liability insurance" in the amounts of not less than $1,000,000.00
bodily injury and $250,000.00. The City of Darien and the local fire protection district shall be
added as an "additional insured.”

(T) Add section 3406:9 5706.9 - to read:
Section 3406:9 5706.9 - Special Dispensers. Special type dispensers such as coin, key or card-

operated devices, for self service operation by the general public are prohibited unless there is
an attendant on duty at all times.

{Ord. 0-11-07, 4-2-2007)

4-1-8-3: DEFINITIONS AND ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS OF INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 20...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(A) Definitions:

1. Fire Prevention Code Or Code: Wherever the words "fire prevention code" or "code" are
used in the codes adopted herein by reference, they shall be held to mean the city of Darien
2006 2012 international fire code.

2. Municipality: Wherever the word "municipality” is used in the codes adopted herein by
reference, it shall be held to mean the city of Darien.

3. City: Wherever the word "city" is used in the codes adopted herein by reference, it shall be
held to mean the city of Darien.

4. Corporation Counsel: Wherever the term "corporation counsel” is used in the codes adopted
herein by reference, it shall be held to mean the legal counsel for the city of Darien.

5. Fire Official, Code Official, Fire Marshal, Authority Having Jurisdiction Or Chief Of The Bureau
Of Fire Prevention: Wherever the term "fire official", "code official", "fire marshal”, "authority
having jurisdiction"” or "chief of the bureau of fire prevention" is used in the codes adopted
herein by reference, it shall be held to mean the director of community development or his
designee.

6. Bureau Of Fire Prevention: Wherever the term "bureau of fire prevention” is used in the
codes adopted herein by reference, it shall be held to mean department of community
development.

(B) Administrative Bodies:

1. The fire prevention code shall be enforced by the department of community development of
the city.

2. The person in general charge of the department of community development shall be the
director of community development.

3. The director of the community development department may detail additional personnel as
inspectars to assist in enforcing this chapter.

(C) Application Of Provisions: Except as stated elsewhere in this chapter, any existing building
and/or structure shall be brought into compliance with all applicable provisions of the fire
prevention code in the following situations:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 21...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

1. If the structure or building is increased in floor area or in height, the entire structure or
building shall be made to conform with the requirements of this chapter.

2. If any portion is changed in occupancy, that portion separated by approved fire rated
construction shall be made to conform with the requirements of this chapter.

3. If any portion is altered or remodeled costing in excess of fifty percent (50%) of the fair
market value of the building or structure, such building or structure shall be made to conform
to the requirements of this chapter.

4. If a building or structure is damaged by fire or other cause to the extent in excess of fifty
percent (50%) of the fair market value before the damage was insured, the entire structure or
building {exclusive of foundation) shall meet the requirements of this chapter.

{D) Permits And Approvals:

1. Special Permits: Where special permits are required, application shall be made to the
director of the department of community development. The director shall determine criteria,
limitations and duration of permits until the appropriate requirements are met.

(E) Explosives And Blasting Agents:

1. The storage, handling and use of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited within the city.

(a) Exception: By special permit from the director of the department of community
development.

(F) Flammable Liquids; Liquefied Petroleum Gases:
1. The storage of flammable liquids in outside aboveground tanks is prohibited.

(a) Exception: By special permit from the director of the department of community
development.

2. The bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gases in excess of one thousand (1,000) gallons
water capacity is prohibited.

{a) Exception: By special permit from the director of the department of community
development.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 22...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(G) Manufacturing And Storage Of Fireworks Prohibited: The manufacture and storage of
fireworks is prohibited within the corporate limits of the city, except by special permit issued by
the code official.

(H) Motor Vehicle Routes For Vehicles Transporting Hazardous Chemicals Or Other Dangerous
Articles, Including Liquefied Petroleum Gases And Combustible And Flammable Liquids: The
routes referred to in section 20.14 of the fire prevention code for vehicles transporting
hazardous chemicals and other dangerous articles are hereby established as routes approved
by state, county or federal governments.

No tank vehicles shall be parked for over one hour or left unattended at any time.

(1) Emergency Conditions: When in the opinion of the director of the department of community
development or his designee there is actual and immediate danger because of hazardous
conditions which endanger life or may cause effects upon adjoining properties, the bureau may
order the building to be immediately vacated and cause immediate remedial action if
necessary. The cost of such remedial action shall be borne by the owner of the premises.

{J) Modifications: The director of the department of community development and the city
administrator shall have power to modify any of the provisions of the fire prevention code upon
application in writing by the owner or lessee, or his duly authorized agent, when there are
practical difficulties in the way of carrying out the strict letter of the code; provided that the
spirit of the code shall be observed, public safety and substantial justice done. The particulars
of such modification, when granted or allowed, and the decision of the fire marshal shall he
entered upon the records of the department and a signed copy shall be furnished the applicant.

(K) New Materials, Processes Or Occupancies Requiring Permits: Upon a written request to
employ new materials, processes or occupancies which require a permit or otherwise alter the
provisions of the fire code, in addition to those now enumerated in said code, the director of
community development shall forward said request along with supporting documentation and
other applicable information as determined by the director of community development and city
administrator to the building plan review and building inspection consultants employed by the
city, to the local fire district and when applicable, to the city engineer, for their review and
recommendation. Upon receipt of the recommendations from these sources, the director of
community development and city administrator shall either approve or deny said request. In
either situation, the determination made shall be posted in a conspicuous place at the Darien
city hall, and copies shall be distributed to all parties.

(L) Penalties: The penalty for violation of this code shall be in accordance with the city code
penalty section.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 23...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

4-1-9: INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE:

4-1-9-1: ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE:

There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled
“2012 international energy conservation code”, printed in pamphlet form by the International
Code Council, including no errata sheets inserted therein as modified in certain respects as set
forth herein, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the city.

4-1-9-2: AMENDMENTS TQ CODE:

(A} Section 101.1 — Insert City of Darien for [name of jurisdiction].

4-1-9 4-1-10: EXISTING STRUCTURES REGULATIONS:

4-1-9-1 4-1-10-1: ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE:

There is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as part of this section, the code entitled
"2006 2012 international property maintenance code", printed in pamphlet form by the
international Code Council, including no errata sheets inserted therein as modified in certain
respects as set forth herein, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the city.

4-1-9-2 4-1-10-2: AMENDMENTS TO CODE:

The international property maintenance code, as adopted in section 4-1-9-1 of this chapter
shall be amended as follows:

(A) Section 101.1 - Insert "city of Darien for [name of jurisdiction].
(B} Section 106.4 - Penalties. Revise to read as follows:

See the city code of Darien for penalties for violations of the provisions of this code.
(Ord. 0-11-07, 4-2-2007)

4-1-10 4-1-11: PERMITS AND FEES:
4-1-10-4 4-1-11-1: PERMIT REQUIRED; ISSUANCE:

A building permit, as provided for herein, shall first be required before any construction,
alteration, repair or removal within the city shall be commenced. No work shall be done and no




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 24...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

permit as required by these regulations shall be issued until the fee prescribed therefor has
been paid and all other requirements for such permit have been met. {Ord. 0-11-07, 4-2-2007)

4-1-30-2 4-1-11-2: GENERAL REQUIREMENTS:

(A) Plat Of Survey With Application: A plat of survey shall be submitted with a building permit
application. The plat of survey shal! be prepared by a registered land surveyor of the state of
llfinois and include topographical data showing existing contours at vertical intervals of not less
than two feet {2'), proposed changes in contours, proposed foundation and elevations and
other land improvements within the platted property and surrounding properties.
Topographical data shall refer to true USGS elevation standards.

{B) Spotted Survey Required: Two (2) copies of a spotted survey will be required within
fourteen (14) days after the foundation is placed on the lot. The spotted survey shall include
the true USGS elevations of the top of foundation wall and existing grade of curb, sidewalk or
existing grade of street or roadway. It shall also include all building setbacks from the property
boundaries. No construction will be permitted past the decking over the foundation except for
water, sanitary sewer and related items unless such survey has been filed and approved by the
department of community development staff.

(C) Final Grading Survey Required: Two {2) copies of a final grading survey will be required no
less than four (4) days prior to the request for final occupancy. The final grading survey shall
include topographical data showing final contours at vertical intervals of not less than two feet
(2') based on true USGS elevation standards. A certificate of occupancy will not be issued until
the final grading survey is approved by the city engineer.

In any residential zoning district, no permit may be issued for additional work if there remains
uncompleted other work on the premises for which a building permit has been issued for more
than twelve (12) months.

(D) Duration Of Permits:

1. Duration: The duration of a building permit shall be one year from the date of issuance.

2. Permit Extensions: Upon approval of the building official, a building permit may be extended
for a period not to exceed six (6) months on payment of fifty percent (50%) of the original

building permit fee.

3. One Permit Limit: No more than one building permit shail be issued for a property unless
construction required under the first building permit continues at a reasonable level.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 25...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

4. Suspension Of Permit: Any building permit issued, but under which no work has commenced
within six (6) months after issuance of the permit, or if the authorized work is suspended or
abandoned for a period of six (6) months after the time of commencing, the permit shall expire
by its own terms. The permit must be surrendered to the building inspector within ten (10) days
after its expiration, and fees paid therefor shall be forfeited to the city. Upon such surrender,
fifty percent {50%) of the total permit fee shall be refunded.

(E) Contractor Registration Requirements:

1. All contractors;-exeept-electrical and plumbing-eontractors; shall obtain a city contractor's

license. This shall include all subcontractors. The Darien contractor's license year runs from May
1 to April 30. There is an annual fee with a one-half (*/,) year fee after November 1.

2. Electrical contractors shall give evidence of good standing by supplying a copy of the
registration with any other city, county or state jurisdiction in Illinois.

3. Plumbing contractors must be licensed with the state of lllinois and shall submit a copy of
their license. Plumbi i i i
license:

4. Roofing contractors must be licensed with the state of Illinois and shall submit a copy of their

license and-shall-berequired-to-obtain-a-contractorslicense.
5. All contractors ineludingplumbingelectrical and reofing contracters , except for plumbers,

roofers, lawn sprinkler and fire alarm contractors, shall submit the following to the city:

(a) A ten thousand dollar {$10,000.00) license bond. The general contractor may submit a
twenty thousand dollar {$20,000.00) license bond in lieu of separate bonds on each
subcontractor.

(b) A certificate of liability insurance.

(c) $60.00 annual fee.
The above changes reflect current practice as well as changes in State law.

6. License bond requirement may be waived where the owner of a single-family house is acting
as a general contractor.

(F) Construction Vehicle Driveways: For any construction which does not include a hard surface
for construction vehicles, a stone driveway must be laid within five (5) days of the placement of
a foundation on a property.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 26...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(G} Erosion Control Devices: Erosion control devices such as silt fencing or hay bales shall be
erected around the perimeter of any property under construction which includes earthwork.

(H) Sidewalk Construction Required Along Major Arterial Streets:

1. The city shall not issue any building permits for construction taking place along "major
arterial streets”, as defined hereafter, unless the applicant for the building permit and the
owner of the property shall execute an acknowledgement that no occupancy permit for the
building or structure will be issued unless sidewalks, constructed in accordance with the
ordinances of the city, are installed along such major arterial streets prior to the occupancy of
the building or structure. In lieu of the installation of the sidewalk prior to occupancy, and at
the option of the city, the owner of the property may post a cash deposit with the city equal to
the then current cost of installing the sidewalk or such other security acceptable to the city.
This cash sum or other security shall be retained by the city until such time as it is most
convenient for the city to install or to have installed such sidewalk segment either singly or as
part of a larger sidewalk construction program. If, at the time the sidewalk is eventually
installed, the cost of installing the sidewalk shall exceed the amount of the cash sum or other
security posted, the owner shall be obligated, upon thirty (30) days' written notice, to increase
the amount of that cash sum or other security in an amount sufficient to enable the city to
install or to have installed the sidewalk. In the event that the cost of installing the sidewalk shall
be less than the cash sum or other security deposited with the city, the amount of such excess
will be returned to the owner after the sidewalk is installed and all costs for the installation of
the sidewalk have been paid.

2. For the purpose of this subsection, "major arterial streets" within the city shall be defined as
follows:

(a) Route 83.

(b) Clarendon Hills Road.
(c) Plainfield Road.

(d) Cass Avenue.

(e) 75th Street.

(f) Bailey Road.

(g) North and South Frontage Roads.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 27..Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

{h) Manning Road.
{i) Lemont Road.
{j) 83rd Street.

3. Any person who violates any provision of this subsection {H) shall upon conviction thereof be
fined not less than fifty dollars {$50.00) nor more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). Every day
upon which a violation of this subsection (H) takes place shall be deemed to be a separate
offense.

(1} Permitted Hours Of Construction:

1. No construction for which a building permit is required under this chapter shall commence
before the hour of six thirty o'clock {6:30) A.M. or continue after the hour of ten o'clock (10:00)
P.M. on Monday through Friday, or commence before the hour of seven thirty o'clock (7:30)
A.M. or continue after the hour of ten o'clock {10:00) P.M. on Saturday or Sunday.

2. Any person who violates any provision of this subsection {1} shall be fined not less than fifty
dollars {$50.00) nor more than five hundred dollars {$500.00) for a first offense. Any person
who violates any provision of this subsection (l) a second or subsequent time shall be fined not
less than one hundred dollars ($100.00} nor more than five hundred dollars {$500.00). In
addition, violation of this provision may be deemed cause for revocation of the building permit.

{Ord. 0-11-07, 4-2-2007)
4-1-10-3 4-1-11-3; PERMIT FEES:

(A) Plan Review Fees: Plan review fees are accessed through outside professional services.

Single-family residence ["‘5315.00
Residential additions | 215.00
Detached garage H115.00
Multi-family residence | [315.00 per dwelling unit :g}
Basement remodeling, deck, { 115.00
shed, etc.

.Commercial, office, industrial 0.003 x construction cost as determined by the most current
’ publication of the "Means Cost Estimating Guide"

Elevators, escalators, |‘|100.00




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 28...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

dumbwaiters, piatfc;;;n lifts

Parking lots ?10000

Sign permits 5 250.00

‘Resubm ttals 6500 for each

The city reserves the right to employ outside review of any and all plans submitted and the cost
of such review will be paid by the applicant.

(B} Construction Permit Fees:

1. Computing Fees: For the purposes of computing fees, all subordinate detached buildings, the
use of which is clearly related to that of the main building located on the same plot, shall be
considered to constitute a part of the main building when included in the same application for a
building permit or when a permit is obtained for the detached subordinate building or buildings
before occupancy of the main building.

2. Building Permit: The building permit fee for all new construction, additions, and alterations
shall be based on the estimated cost of construction including all structural, electrical,
plumbing, mechanical interior finish and site preparation elements. The following table sets
forth said fees:

Construction Cost || [fee
$0.00 - $8,000.00 | 1$75.00
$8,001.00 - $15,000.00 | 1150.00

|
$15,001.00 - $20,000.00 | 1200.00

|

|

|

$20,001.00-$25,000.00 | 25000
$25,001.00 - $35,000.00 | 1500.00

$35,001.00 - $50,000.00 é"ﬂso 00 ;
$50,001.00- $75,000.00 | /1,000.00

$75,001.00 - $100,000.00 | [1,250.00

$100,001.00 - 5150,000.0(5"‘ 11,500.00
$150,001.00 - $200,000.00 | ;2 000.00

Over $200,000.00 | | 12,500.00 +
| 110.00/$1,000.00

}”‘3 Plumblng Permlts A separate plumblng permit.shall be required when plumbing work is not
performed in connection with a required building permit for new construction, alterations,




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 29..Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

additions, repairs or accessory uses. The plumbing permit fee shall be based on the following
schedule:

Residential | [$30-06-perfixture $50.00 |
_Nonre5|dent:a] l IQQ—GQ-per—ﬁx!e&Fe 550 00

Thrs change reﬂecrs current pract:ce

4. Electrical Permits: An electrical permit shall be required when electrical work is not
performed in connection with a required building permit for new construction, alterations,

additions, repairs or accessory uses. The electrical permit fee shall be based on the following
schedule:

Residential | [$3.00-per-outiet plus10.00 per cireuit 50.00 |
?Nonresrdentlal H%—GD—peFeuﬂet—phﬁ—}Q-QQ-peF—ewe%SO 00

Th:s change reﬂects current practrce

5. Elevator Permits;

Elevator | 1$50.00
Escalator H50-00
Dumbwaiter | 130.00

‘Movable stage or orchestra floor HS0.00
Platform lift | 150.00 %
fH:nged platform I|ft HS0.00 "

L L Ak bk S P P e 1

All existing elevators shall be inspected annually, at the cost of the property owner.

6. Permits For Tanks For Flammable Liquids:

$50.00
Add 52.00
$40.00
Add $2.00 -

Class 1 and 2 (1,000 gallon capacity)
[Each 100 gallons or fraction thereof over 1,000

Class 3 and 4 (550 gallons or less)
.Each additional 1,000 gallons or fraction thereof over 550

7. Other Permits Which May Require Plan Review Fee:

Fire protection systems, including, but not limited to, 5 50.00
range hoods, sprinklers, alarms




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 30...0raft: Updated October 18, 2012

Residential air conditioner

Commercial conditioner 5

Building demolition:

500 square feet or less

Over 500 squére feet

Tank removal

5W|mm|ng poo[.:....‘ . : ;

HE

Aboveground | 50.00

Inground ” B | 100.00

Fence

5éck

Satellite disﬁm




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 31...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

75.00 for private and work within
street right-of-way

1100 to 800 square feet HS0.00
]
Steam boiler 17500
| |
Incinerator (state approved): H
]

5 square feet or less ; 50.00
Each additional 5 square feet lm|5.00
i

Driveways/parking lots: H
: ]
Residential 25,00
| 50.00 for private portion of
driveway;

Nonresidential | Is6.06 100.00
| |
Other permits | I50.00

8. 5ign Permits: The erection, construction or alteration of any sign, or its advertising structure,
margquee, canopy or awning, requires a sign permit based on the following schedule:

éNoniIIuminated signs (unless temporary} plus $1.00 per square foot of gross ) $100.00
surface area of each face thereof
fTemporary signs l }35.00
Marquees, canopies and awnings plus $0.20 per square foot of gross surface area ! |20.00
Illuminated signs plus $2.00 per square foot of gross surface area of each face 200.00
thereof
Reface of existing sign I }100.00

" I
Permanent residential development sign as described in subsection 4-3-10{A)3 of No chargeﬁ;
this title ;

9. Other Fees:




BUILDING REGUILATIONS
Page 32...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

Reinspection:

H

i

First occurrence 35 80.00
1100.00

Second occurrence

Work started without permit

-Final occupa"l;lméy

First offense

Subsequent offense

Elevator inspection

{C} Independent Inspectors: The city may, from time to time, hire an independent inspector to
make inspections which cannot be performed by the staff building inspectors. The cost of said
inspections shall be paid by the builder.

(D) Reinspections: Whenever a reinspection is required, due to inaccurate information or
construction, an additional fee of eighty dollars ($80.00) shall be charged for the first
reinspection. A one hundred dollar (5100.00) fee shall be charged for each additional
reinspection after the first reinspection. This fee shall be payable prior to the reinspection being
performed.

(E) Failure To Receive Required Inspection: If a builder fails to receive a required inspection and
continues to work, there shall be a one hundred dollar ($100.00) fee. A building inspector may
require removal of any unauthorized work in order to adequately make a required inspection.

(F} Work Started Without A Permit: Whenever work for which a permit is required is
commenced without a permit, the applicant shal! pay the following additional fees:

Fifty dollars ($50.00) for the first three thousand dollars ($3,000.00) of construction cost, and
twenty dollars (520.00) per one thousand dollars ($1,000.00) of additional cost of construction
in order to reimburse the city for clerical, inspection and other administrative expenses.




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 33..Draft: Updated Octeober 18, 2012

{G) Permit Pick Up: Building permits must be picked up within sixty (60) days of approval. If a
permit is not picked up within sixty (60) days, it will become null and void and the applicant will
be charged the applicable plan review fee.

{H) Temporary Certificate Of Occupancy (Valid For A Period Not To Exceed 120 Days):

Residential I [$100 00 plus cash bond for cost of outstanding work ?;

'Commerual l [150 OO plus cash bond for cost ofoutstandmg work

In addition, the seller/owner of any property for which a temporary certificate of occupancy is
sought shall post the following sums to ensure the completion of incomplete items as follows:

site grading ['1$5,000.00 ;
Sidewalk HlS.OO per square foot
Concrete driveway approach/private driveway 1—115.00 per square foot
Asphalt driveway approach/private - 110.00 per square foot
driveway ;

Private landscaping tm )

Public landscaping, infrastructure, 3,000.00
storm sewer, storm sewer structure

and water valves %

Such sums shall be released upon the issuance of a final certificate of occupancy. In the event
all or a portion of said work is not completed by the expiration of the prescribed period of not
to exceed one hundred twenty (120} days, the city may, in its discretion, release such funds to
the property owner or cause uncompleted work to be completed.

{1} Final Certificate Of Occupancy: $50.00
(Ord. 0-11-07, 4-2-2007)

4-1-10-4 4-1-11-4: DUPAGE COUNTY FAIR SHARE TRANSPORTATION IMPACT FEE:

In addition to any other requirements of this code, no building permit or occupancy permit shall
issue for improvements subject to the requirements of the DuPage County fair share
transportation impact fee ordinance, county ordinance OTD-021-89, as said ordinance may be
amended from time to time, until the applicant for such permit furnishes the city with a copy of
a receipt of payment of DuPage County's impact fee. {Ord. 0-11-07, 4-2-2007)

4-1-10-5: REDUCED FEES WHEN APPLICATION MADE BY LOCAL GOVERNMENT BODY:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 34...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(A) Whenever a local governmental body (schaool district, library district, fire protection district,
park district, community college district, county, forest preserve) makes application for work for
which a permit fee is required pursuant to this title or any other title of this code, the permit
fee will be reduced by a percentage equal to the percentage that such governmental body's
taxable property, as determined by the most recent assessed valuation, is also taxable property
within the city of Darien. For example, if ninety five percent (95%) of a local governmental
body's assessed valuation is located within the city of Darien, then the permit fee shall be
reduced by ninety five percent (95%).

(B) Local governmental permit applicants shall be required to pay or reimburse the city for any
actual expenses (such as consultant plan review fees) incurred by the city as part of the city's
permit application review.

(C) Local governmental permit applicants shall provide the city of Darien with sufficient
information showing the assessed valuation calculation in order to have a permit fee reduction.
(Ord. 0-54-07, 12-17-2007)

4-1-11 4-1-12: REMOVAL OF CERTAIN IMPROVEMENTS IN BUSINESS DISTRICTS:

4-1-31-1 4-1-12-1: REMOVAL OF PERSONAL PROPERTY:

Whenever any improved property located in one of the city's business districts has been out of
operation for more than three (3} months, the owner of the property shall remove the
following items of personal property therefrom:

{A) Freestanding signage;

{B) Canopies or canopy superstructures {specifically in the case of automobile service stations);
{C) Directional signage;

{D} Accessory structures, dumpsters;

{E} Gasoline pumps. (Ord. 0-36-06, 8-21-2006)

4-1-11-2 4-1-12-2: CONTACT PERSON; ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

At the direction of the city the owner and/or authorized agent of any business referred to
hereinabove shall provide the city with the following information:




BUILDING REGULATIONS
Page 35...Draft: Updated October 18, 2012

(A) Name, address, daytime and emergency phone number of responsible parties;
(B) Good faith estimate of time building is expected to remain vacant;

(C) Status of any compliance measures required by other governmental agencies, including, but
not limited to, the Illinois environmental protection agency and Illinois state fire marshal office.

The information provided above shall be updated on a quarterly basis. {Ord. 0-36-06, 8-21-
2006)

4-1-11-3 4-1-12-3: ONGOING MAINTENANCE:

The owner of any such abandoned building shall maintain landscaping on the grounds,
including the parkway, in a reasonable condition, in compliance with all city ordinances
regarding maintenance and outdoor landscaping. All buildings shall be secured. Debris, graffiti,
abandoned vehicles, and garbage shall be removed from the property within forty eight (48)
hours' notice by the city. {Ord. 0-36-06, 8-21-2006)

4-1-11-4: PENALTY; REMOVAL; LIEN:

Any owner of property who fails to remove the improvements identified herein within fourteen
(14) days of notice from the city, and who fails to maintain the property in accordance with the
provisions of this section 4-1-11 shall be subject to a fine of not less than one hundred dollars
($100.00) and not more than seven hundred fifty dollars ($750.00). Each day's violation shall be
considered a separate offense. The city may enter upon the property to cause the removal of
the structures which are maintained on such property in violation of this provision. In such case
the city's costs, along with a reasonable administrative fee, shall operate as a lien against that
property. In such case, the city administrator shall cause a notice of lien to be filed against the
property in the office of the DuPage County recorder of deeds. (Ord. 0-36-06, 8-21-2006)




AGENDA MEMO
Municipal Services Committee
October 22, 2012

ISSUE STATEMENT
A resolution accepting a proposal from Rag’s Electric, in an amount not to exceed $28,200.00 for the

Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping at Plant 3-1930 Manning Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road
and Plant 5-8700 block of Lemont Road.

BACKGROUND/HISTORY

The proposed expenditure includes the removal of obsolete electrical equipment and components
for the water facilities located at Plant 3-1930 Manning Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road and
Plant 5-8700 block of Lemont Road. The housekeeping is required due to the removal of water
softening and well equipment from when the City converted to Lake Michigan water.

The staff had requested competitive quotes from seven (7) electrical vendors and received only one
responsive quote on October 4, 2012, see Attachment A, The staff reached out to all the vendors
inquiring as to why they did not submit. The responses were from “to busy”, “not interested” and
“forgot about due date™. Cattaneo Electric Co submitted a quote on October 8, 2012, after the due
date of October 4, and was $3,950 less than the responsive quote. Since staff had only received one

responsive quote, staff reached out to the Rag’s Electric to review their quote to match the non-
responsive quote.

VENDOR TOTAL PROJECT COST | RENEGOTIATED

RAGS ELECTRIC-RESPONSIVE | § 32.600.00 5 28,200.00

CATTANEO ELECTRIC-NON

RESPONSIVE 3 28,605.00

Both vendors have performed various electrical tasks for the City with very satisfactory services.

The FY12/13 budget included $25,000. The remainder of the funding is available from additional
line items within the same account and presented below.

ACCOUNT FY 12/13 | EXPENDITURE PROPOSED
NUMBER ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION BUDGET TO DATE EXPENDITURE | BALANCE

Capital Purchases-Electrical

02-50-4815 | Housekeeping Plants 3,4 and 5 $20,000.00 | § 0 $  20,000.00 g0

02-50-4815 | Capital Purchases-Housekeeping | § 5,000.00 | § 0 b 5,000.60 $0
*Capital Purchases-SCADA

02-50-4815 | System Upgrade $ 880000 1% 2970.00 | § 3,200.00 $ 2.630.00

TOTALS $33,800.00 [§ 297000 |%  28200.00 $ 2,630.00




Electrical Housekeeping Plants 3-4-5
October 22, 2012
Page 2

*Cost Savings realized through competitive quotes for SCADA Equipment.

Staff Recommendation

Staff recommends approval of this resolution with Rag’s Electric, in an amount not to exceed
$28,200.00 for the Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping at Plant 3-1930 Manning Road, Plant 4-
1897 Manning Road and Plant 5-8700 block of Lemont Road.

Alternate Consideration
As directed by the Municipal Services Committee.

Decision Mode
This item will be placed on the November 5, 2012 City Council agenda for formal consideration.




S - € SB[ J0M ILDIYH - SINSY SHIOND\SWLAT PIEVX

TLY18°8T $ 00°0¥E'RT $ 00°0VLCE £ [ele L
07'86 $ 00'0S $ 00°0¢ b Jad{sH UBILIOA]H
A1 18! $ 00°06 $ 00°06 b UBLIO9{H
15918y J0qeT A{INOH
00°509°82 § 00'002°8T $ 00'009°CE $ [el01-qng
00°0T6°C1 $ 00'006°CI $ 00'009%1 $ S uE[d [BI0L
00°1+2°8 $ 00'00L°8 $ 00°001°01 $ ¥ JUB[{ [EI0OL
00'¥SP9 g 00'009°9 $ 00'006°L $ £ e jBio],

[B10L [BICL, [810], NOILARIDSdd| WHI1T
2AISuOdSaY[-UON parenofaN-aY aarsuodsay
C1/8/Q1 paaleoayg T1/T1/01 paaEaay Tl-F-01 paaleIay
Aueduoy) 011199]H 09UERED AuBdwWIo)) 911091 S.3eY Auedwo)) o11109[7 5,58y

"we §0:01 @ 10T *v 12q010 HIvaand
G 79 ¢ ‘¢ sjue[d Furdeayasnol soUguLUIBIA [BOLIIS[H ALONO

19509 I °NARIVA
dVOd ATHAIANIV'Id TOLT
V yuaumgeny SAOM DITd01d NATIVA 40 ALLD




Dan Gombac

S S e S S IR
From: ragselectric@aol.com

Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2012 7:54 AM

To: Ban Gombac

Subject: Re: Water Plant Quotes

Attachments: darienpumps 1.pdf; darienpumps 2.pdf; darienpumps 3.pdf; darienpumps.pdf

Dan,

Please see attached quote for $28,200.00.

Rick Grant

Rag's Electric
630-739-RAGS (7247) = Office
630-327-6402 = Cell

—-0riginal Message—

From: Dan Gombac <dgombac@darienil.gov>

To: ragselectric <ragselectiic@acl.com>

Cc: Ashley Prueter <gprueter@darienil.gov>; Bryon Vana <bvana@darienil.gov>; Kris Throm <kthrom@darienil.gov>;
Dan Salvato <dsalvato@darienil.gov=>

Sent: Tue, Oct 8, 2012 4:33 pm

Subject: Water Plant Quotes

Good afternoon Rick:

As per our recent telephone conversation you (Rags Electric) were the only vendor that had submitied a competitive
quote for the electrical work at the pump houses. We had received one additional quote after the due date and time. See
attached quotes. The second quote received is $3,995 dollars less than your quote. The budget estimate was $25,000 for
the proposed work. Since you were the responsive quote we are requesting your review of the quote to consider matching
the 2™ quote. Again please keep in mind that the cost is $3,995 over the proposed budget and may consider eliminating
one of the three proposed progects.

Please review and let me know by no later than Qctober 12.
Thank you in advance for your consideration.
Dancel gamfdc

Denector of Manieipal Serocces
650-3553- 8106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for

our electronic newsletter:
DARIEN DIRECT CORNNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html




R:_‘%.T; 7

In the County of DuPage and the State of Illnois
Incorporated 18593

September 18, 2012

The City of Darien is soliciting for competitive quotes for Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
at several of the City’s water facility stations. The housekeeping includes the removal of
obsolete electrical equipment and components for the facilities located at Plant 3-1930 Manning
Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road and Plaut 5-8700 block of Lemnont Road. The housekeeping
is required due to the removatl of soflening and well equipment from when the City converted o
Lake Michipan water.

The scope of work shall include the following:

A. Plant 3-1932 Manuning Road
Furnish and instal! the necessary electrical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
panels and transfer swilch and replace with new metering and panels as outlined below:

1. Remove existing 200-ampere main switch,

2. Remove existing generator transfer switch.

3. Rework existing chlorine and starier and rework CL2 wiring to new panel.

4. Remove existing transformer.

5. Remove (1) abandoned well starter and wiring back to junction box at wall.

6. Furnish and install (1) 200-ampere main C/B with C/B’s for reconnected equipment.
The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks for foture.

7. Furnish and install\(1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.

8. Refeed existing 120/208 voll panel.

9. Ground service and transformer per code.

Material Cost 5 2.950.00 0607

-

Labor Cosl $ 4,950.00 Y Loo

-~

Plant 3 Total Cost §  7,980700 LoD
-

B. Plant 4-1897 Manniog Road

Fumnish and insial] the necessary electrical maierials and labor to remove existing 480-voll
motor coniro] center and replace il with new metering and panel as outlined below:

1. Remove 5-section'motor contro] center. S :

2. Furnish and install new 480-volt 200-amp Com-Ed-meter on exterior of building. -

1702 Piainfield Road | Darian, Mincis B0561 | Area 6530 | 852-5000

e T R i P B AL T PR L




il e e

Elecirical Maintanance Housekeeping
September 18, 2012
Poge 2

Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208 volt transformer.

e

for future.

6. Disconnect and remove circuits related to old purap station
7. Existing conduit shall be utilized.

. ’/ -
Material Cost $ j/&z( 00 3,500
Labor Cost b Ejﬁ' L 00 s\lﬂaf
Plant 4 Total Cost 8 1040000 700"

C. 8600 Lemont Road

Fumnish and install the necessary electrical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V

motor contro! center and replace it with a new metering and panels as outlined below:

Remove existing (4) section motor control center.

Remove existing purop control panel.

Remove (3) exdsting feeders from motor control center to Com-Ed transformer.
Rework (1) feeder to new C/T cabinet and pull new wire from C/T to Com-Ed
transformer.

5. Furnish and install a 400-ampere C/T meter cabinet with remote meter on exterior
building.

el el

6. Fumnish and install {1) 400-ampere main C/B panel with C/B’s to power existing circuits

that are to remain.

7. Furnish and install (1) 125 ampere main C/B panel with the necessary C/B’s to power

= existing circuits that will remain. The panel shall have 6 spare circnit breaker
spaces/blanks for future.
8. Remove all circuits that are no longer required.
9. Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.
10. Ground service and transformer.

Material Cost g 6,156700 L,200"
Labor Cost 3 7,856700 L\ 200"
Plant 5 Total Cost 5 14,606700_ 12,900

General:

The vendor may be required to perform additional tasks that may be unforeseen. Any

extraordinary expenses shall be paid for as followsi ..o« i stz oo i s s,

e mre - L e o e s . Cie eemm e R .. - e LB been .

Furnish and install new 3-phase 4-W 480-volt panel board with (1) 60A 3-pole C/B.

Furnish and install (1) 125-amp main C/B panel and circuit breakers to reefed 120-
volt circuits as required. The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks

e N T L




Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18, 2012
Pape 3

Material-Invoice + 15%- No tax

Hourly Labor Rates:
Electrician b 90,00
Eleciricians Helper 5 50. Db

All extraordinary tasks shall not require more than 2 people. If required, authorization shall be
required for more than 2 people. All extra work shall be approved prior to commencement of
work.

General notes:

1. All permii costs required by the City shall be waived.

2. The awarded vendor shall provide a copy of their elecirical license with the bid and proof
of a certificate of insurance.

3. All work shall be in accordance with the 2005 National Electrical Code.

4, A scheduled pre-bid walk through has been scheduled for Sept 25, 2012 at 8:30 am

at Plant 3-locaied % block north of Plainfield Road at 1930 Manning Rd. See

attached map. The pre bid walkthrough is NOT mandatory and will noi hold any

additional walkthroughs after said date.

All equipment shall be Square D-no exceptions

City will dispose of all discarded equipment

All panels shall be clearly labeled and identified

All outages shall be scheduled by the awarded vendor

%N W

The project is anticipated to begin by November 7, 2012 aod completed by December 20, 2012.
Sealed quotes will be accepted until October 4, 2012, uatil the hour of 10:00 a.m. Quotes shall
be opened and read aloud at 10:00 am at the City of Darien, 1702 Plainficld Road-upstairs
Conference Room. Sealed quotes may be mailed or delivered to the City of Darien at 1702
Plainfield Road and clearly maried as Electrical Maintenance-Water Facilities, ATTN: Ashley
Pruater. -

Any and all requests or addendums shall be made in writing to the attention of the Director of
Municipal Services via fax or e-mail to 630-852-4709 or dgombac(@darienil.gov. All requests
will be responded to within 48 hours to all bidders on file.




Elrctrical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18,2012

Page 4 CITY OF DARIEN

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND SEALED AND RETURNED TG 1702
PLAINFIELD ROAD BY NO LATER THAN OCTOBER 4, 2012 - 10 A.M.
ATTN: PUBLIC WORKS
QUESTIONS MAY BE DIRECTED TO MUNICIPAL SERVICES AT 630-353-8105

Submitted by: Raa's Electric Company
Vendor Name: Rag's Electric Company
Address: 16244 BIuff Road Lemont, 11 60439
Date: 10-04-2012
Phane #: 630-739-7247 Fax s 030-739-7424
E-mail Address: ragselectyicBaol.com)
<
Authorized Signatare: e »
Quote Amount: $32 500.00 {Total for all 3-Plants) St res
-

The vendor shall provide tliree references with phone numbers below:

1. Village of Hodgkins - #708-579-6700
2 Yiilage of Lemont - #630-257-2532
3. City of Darien - #630-852-5000

Aceeptanee of Quote:

By: Dale:
City of Darien

Authorized and Accepted:

By:

Title:

Date: : — e




Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18,2012

Page 4 CITY OF DARIERN

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND SEALED AND RETURNED TO 1702
PLAINFIELD ROAD BY NO LATER THAN OCTOBER 4, 2012 — 10 A.IVX,
ATTN: PUBLIC WORKS
QUESTIONS MAY BE DIRECTED TO MUNICIPAL SERVICES AT 630-353-8105

Submitted by: Rag's Electric Company
Vendor Name: Rag's Electric Company
Address: 16244 Bluff Road Lemont, I1 60439
Date: 10-04-2012
Phone #: 630-739-7247 fax g 030-738-7424
E-mail Address: ragselectric@aol. com)
"/ DW=
Authorized Signature: IS, Al LAad,
Quote Amount: $32.600.00 (Total for all 3-Plants)

Quote Amount in Writing: _ Thirty Two Thousand.-Six:Hundred Dollars and no/100.

The vendor shall provide three references with phone numbers below:

1. Village of Hodgkins - #708-579-6700

RS

Village of Lemont - #630-257-2532
3. City of Darien - #630-852-5000

Acceptance of Quote:

By: Dale:

City of Darien

Authorized and Accepted:




Bilinais In the County of DuPage and the State of lllinois
- iIncorporated 19698

Seplember 18, 2012

The City of Darien is soliciting for competitive quotes for Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
at several of the City’s water facility stations. The housekeeping includes the removal of
obsolete electrical equipment and components for the facilities located at Plant 3-1930 Manning
Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road and Plant 5-8700 block of Lemont Road. The housekeeping
is required due to the removal of softening and well equipment from when the City converted to
Lake Michigan water.

The scope of work shall include the following:
A. Plant 3-1932 Manning Road

Furnish and 1nstall the necessary elecirical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
panels and fransfer switch and replace with new metering and panels as outlined below:

1. Remove existing 200-ampere main switch.
2. Remove existing generator transfer switch.
3. Rework existing chlorine and starter and rework CL2 wiring to new panel.
4. Remove existing {ransformer.
5. Remove (1) abandoned well starter and wiring back 1o junction box at wall.
6. Furnish and install (1) 200-ampere main C/B with C/B’s for reconnected equipment.
The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks for future.
7. Furnish and installi(1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.
8. Refeed existing 120/208 volt panel.
9. Ground service and transformer per code.
Material Cost 5 2,950.00 il
Labor Cost $  4,950.00
Plant 3 Total Cost b 7,900.00

B. Plant 4-1897 Manning Road

Furnish and instal] the necessary electrical matenials and labor 1o remove existing 480-volt
motor control center and replace it with new metering and panel as outlined below:

1. Remove 5-section'motor control center.
2. TFumish and install new 480-volt 200-amp Com-Ed-meter on exterior of building.

1702 Plainfield Road | Darien, lincis 60561 | Area B30 | 852-5000




Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18, 2012
Page 2

Furnish and install new 3-phase 4-W 480-volt panel board with (1) 60A 3-pole C/B.

Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208 volt transformer.

. Furnish and install (1) 125-amp main C/B panel and circuit breakers to reefed 120-
volt circuits as required. The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks
for future.

6. Disconnect and remove circuits related to old pump station

7. Existing conduit shall be utilized.

S

Material Cost $ 3,830.00
Labor Cost h) 6,270.00
Plant 4 Total Cost $ 10,100.00

C. 8600 Lemont Road
Furnish and install the necessary electrical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
motor control center and replace it with a new meterning and panels as outlined below:

Remove existing (4) section motor control center.

Remove existing pump control panel.

Remove (3) existing feeders from motor control center to Com-Ed transformer.

Rework (1) feeder to new C/T cabinet and pull new wire from C/T to Com-Ed

transformer.

5. Furnish and install a 400-ampere C/T meter cabinet with remote meter on exterior
building.

6. Furnish and instail (1) 400-ampere main C/B panel with C/B’s to power existing circuits
that are to remain.

7. Furnish and install (1) 125 ampere main C/B panel with the necessary C/B’s to power
existing circuits that will remain. The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker
spaces/blanks for future.

8. Remove all circuits that are no longer required.

9. Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.

10. Ground service and transformer.

Material Cost N 6,750.00
Labor Cost $ 7,850.00
Plant 5 Total Cost hY 14,600.00
General:

The vendor may be required to perform additional tasks that may be unforeseen. Any

.....extraordinary expenses shall be paid for as follows:-, ... .




Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18§, 2012
Page 3

Material-Invoice + 15%- No tax

Hourly Labor Rates:
Electrician $ 96.00
Electricians Helper 5 50.00

All extraordinary tasks shall not require more than 2 people. If required, anthorization shall be
required for more than 2 people. All extra work shall be approved prior to commencement of
work.

General notes:

1. All permit costs required by the City shall be waived.

2. The awarded vendor shall provide a copy of their electrical license with the bid and proof
of a certificate of msurance.

All work shall be in accordance with the 2005 National Electrical Code.

4. A scheduled pre-bid walk through has been scheduled for Sept 25, 2012 at 8:30 am
at Plant 3-located % block north of Plainfield Road at 1930 Manning Rd. See
attached map. The pre bid walkthrough is NOT mandatory and will not hold any
additional walkthroughs after said date.

All equipment shall be Square D-no exceptions

City will dispose of all discarded equipment

All panels shall be clearly labeled and identified

All outages shall be scheduled by the awarded vendor

(W]

N oW

The project is anticipated to begin by November 7, 2012 and completed by December 20, 2012.
Sealed quotes will be accepted until October 4, 2012, until the hour of 10:00 a.m. Quotes shall
be opened and read aloud at 10:00 am at the City of Darien, 1702 Plainfield Road-upstairs
Conference Room. Sealed quotes may be mailed or delivered to the City of Darien at 1702
Plainfield Road and clearly marked as Electrical Maintenance-Water Facilities, ATTN: Ashley
Prueter. .

Any and all requests or addendums shall be made in writing to the attention of the Director of
Municipal Services via fax or e-mail to 630-852-4709 or dgombac(@darienil.gov. All requests
will be responded to within 48 hours to all bidders on file.




lg/@88/2812 23:15 6309109448 CATTANED ELECTRIC PAGE 84

Eleewical Maintepance Housekeeping -
September 18, 2012

Pape 4 T Y OF L2ARIERN

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND SEALED AND RETURNED TO 1702
PLAINFIELD ROAD BY NO LATER THAN OCTOBER 4, 2012 - 10 A.M.
ATTN: PUBLIC WORKS
QUESTIONS MAY BE DIRECTED TO MUNICIPAL SERVICES AT 630-333-8105

Submitted by: Peter Csttaneo

Vendor Namé: Cattaneg Electric Compsny .
Address: €171 5. Lemont Road, Darien IL 60561

Date: 10/8/12

Phope #: 530-910-9400 ¥ax g 830-910-9440

E-mail Address: _petercstian

Aunthorized Signature:

Quote Amount; b 28,603.00

Quote Amount in Writing: twenty eight thousend six hundred five snd zero cents

The vendor shall provide three references with phone numbers below:

1.  Tellabs mr. denis Chase 630-798-6695

2. Dana Victor M:. Victor Martinez 630-271-4856

British Hemes Mr, Mike Jesanski 630-341-4388

Acceptance of Quote:

By: : Date:
City of Darjen

Authorized and Accepied:

By:

Title:

Lt R - . I T - — NI

Date:




2
iB/@a/2e812 23:15 6309169448 CATTANED ELECTRIC PAGE B2

I the County of DuPage and the State of lllinocis
INncorporated 1989

EER \ Jaricn

Nt tler 7

September 18, 2012

The City of Darden is soliciting for competitive guotes for Flectrical Maintenance Housekeeping
at several of the City’s water facility stations. The housekeeping includes the removal of
obsolete electrical equipment and components for the facilities located at Plapt 3-1930 Manning
Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road and Plant 5-8700 black of Lemont Road. The hovnsekeeping
isTequired due to the removal of softening and well equipment from when the City converied io
Lake Michigan water. ‘

The scope of work shall include the following:

A. Plant 3-1932 Manning Road :
Furnish and install the necessery electrical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
panels and transfer switch and replace with new metering and panels as onflined below:

Remove existing 200-ampere main switch.

Remove existing generator transfer switch.

Rework existing chlorine and starter and rework CL2 wiring 10 new panel.

Remove existing transformer. '

Remove (1) abandoned well starter and winng back to junction box ar wall,

Furnish and instal) (1) 200-ampere main C/B with C/B’s for reconnectad equipment,
The panel shal] have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks for future,

Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.

Refeed existing 120/208 volt panel.

Ground service and transformer per code.

B A L

Y

Material Cost $ 3,764 00 - -

Labor Cost $2,780.00

Plant 3 Total Cost $.6,454.00

B. Plant 4-1897 M anning Read

Furnish and instali the necessary electrical materials and labor to remove existing 480-volt
molor control center and replace it with new melering and pane] as outlined below:

1. Remove 3-szction moior control tentey. : e

2. Furnish and instal] new 480-voli 200-amp Com-Ed meter on exterior of building.

1702 Plainfield Road | Darien, llinais 580551 | Area 830 | B852-5r0N0




18/68/20812

23:15 6303169440 CATTANED ELECTRIC PAGE

Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18, 2012

Page 2

Furnish and install new 3-phase 4-W 480-volt panel board with (1) 60A 3-pole C/B.
Furnish and install (1) 45-lcva 480/208 volt iransformer.

Furnish and install (1) 125-amp wnain C/B panel and circuit breakers to reefed 120-
volt circuits as required. The pane] shall have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks
for futare,

6. Disconnect and remove circuits related to old pump station

7. Existing conduit shall be utilized.

s

Material Cost $ 5,461.00

Labor Cost $ 2,780.00

Plant 4 Total Cost $ 8,241.00
C. 3600 Lemont Road

Furnish and instal] the necessary elecirical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
motor contro] center and replace it with & new meteting and panels as outlined belovy:

CRRESES

8.
9.
10,

Remove existing (4} section motor conirol center.

Remove existing pump control] panel. )

Remove (3) existing feeders from motor contro] center to Com-Ed transformer.
Rework (1) feeder to new C/T cabinet and pull new wire frorm C/T to Com-Ed
transformer.

Furnish and install 2 400-ampere C/T meter cabinet with remote tmeter op exterior
building.

Furniish and justall (1) 400-ampere maip C/B panel with C/B’s to power existing circuits
that are to remajin. '

Fumish and install (1) 125 ampere main C/B panel with the necessary C/B’s to power
existing circuits that will remain. The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker
spaces/blauks for future,

Remove all circuits that are no longer required.

Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.

Ground service and transformer. ~

Material Cost $7,630.00

Labor Cost % 6,280.00

Plant 5

Total Cost £13,910.00

General:

The vendor may be required to perform additional tasks that may be unforeseen. Any
. . extraordinary expenses shall be pard for as follows: o i1 - cemrien e e e

[P, P . —

83




18/88/26012 23:15 630914939448 CATTANED ELECTRIC PAGE  BS

Elecirical Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18, 2012
Page 3

Material-Invoice + 153%- No tax

Hourly Labor Rates:
Electrician g 111.32
Electricians Helper 5 98.40

All extraordinary tasks shall not require more than 2 people. If required, authorization shall be
required for more than 2 people. All extra work shall be approved prior to commencement of
work.

General notes:

1. All permit costs required by the City shall be waived.

2. The awarded vendor shall provide a copy of their electrical license with the bid and proof

of a certificate of insurance.

All work shall be in accordance with fhe 2005 National Electrical Code.

4. A scheduled pre-bid walk through has been scheduled for Sept 25, 2012 2t 8:30 am
at Plant 3-located % block north of Plainfield Road at 1930 Manning Rd. See

attached map. The pre bid wallithrough is NOT mandatory and will not hold any
additional walkthroughs after said date.

All equipment shall be Square D-no exceptions

City will dispose of all discarded equipment

All panels shall be clearly labeled and identified

All outages shall be schediifed by the awarded vendor

L

90 21 o

The project is anticipated 1o begin by November 7, 2012 and completed by December 20, 2012.
Sealed quotes will be accepted unti) QevbertFR0T 2 it e Honi 6 F0:00-ames Quotes shall
be opened and read aloud at 10:00 am at the City of Darien, 1702 Plainfield Road-upstairs
Conference Room. Sealed quotes may be mailed or delivered to the City of Darien at 1702

Plainfield Road and clearly marked as Electrical Maintenance-Water Facilities, ATTN: Ashley
Pruster, .

Any and all requests or addendums shall be made in writing to the attention of the Director of
Municipal Services via fax or e-mail to 630-832-4709 or dgombac@darienil.gov. All requests
will be responded to within 48 hours to all bidders on file.




16/88/2612 23:15 6363109448 CATTANED EILECTRIC PAGE 61

Cattaneo sectric C ompany
8171 8. Lemont Road
Darien, Hlinois 60561
- www.cattaneoelectric . net
Office # (630)910-9400 Facsimile # (630)210-9440
Email: Cattanso@AOL.com '

Date 0/ 9/ /7. ‘
Send to Facsimiie numbey; é)}a ?5_ Z /7'/7 Og

. Please direct 1o .Q\al/\

f"_" - .
Company: | }w <A
Sent b\f“ ~\ Ii \_e &

Rega.rdgncr ‘
(G
- Hard copy sant via mail: y@

Please see attachad:
Number of pages (Including cover sheet); }
Please deliver this text lﬂlm.EdlaLEij to adctressea |

- Please contact vs if, you experience any problems receiving ﬂus facsimiie
transmission.




RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING A PROPOSAL FROM RAG’S ELECTRIC IN AN
AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $28,200.00 FOR THE ELECTRICAL MAINTENANCE
HOUSEKEEPING AT PLANT 3-1930 MANNING ROAD, PLANT 4-1897 MANNING

ROAD AND PLANT 5-8700 BLOCK OF LEMONT ROAD

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE
COUNTY, ILLINOIS, as follows:

SECTION 1: The City Council of the City of Darien hereby authorizes the Mayor and City
Clerk to accept a proposal from Rag’s Electric in an amount not to exceed $28,200.00 for the
electrical maintenance housekeeping at Plant 3-1930 Manning Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road
and Plant 5-8700 block of Lemont Road, a copy of which is attached hereto as “Exhibit A”.

SECTION 2: This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval as provided by law.

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE COUNTY,
ILLINOIS, this 5™ day of November 2012.

AYES:
NAYS:
ABSENT:

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE COUNTY,
TLLINOIS, this 5" day of November 2012.

KATHLEEN MOESLE WEAVER, MAYOR
ATTEST:

JOANNE E. RAGONA, CITY CLERK

APPROVED AS TO FORM

CITY ATTORNEY




Exhibit A

Elrctrical Mainlenance Housekeeping
Septermber 18, 2012

Page 4 GITY OF DARIEN

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND SEALED AND RETURNED TG 1702
PLAINFIELD ROAD BY NO LATER THAN OCTOBER 4, 2012 — 10 A.VE.
ATTN: PUBLIC WORKS
QUESTIONS MAY BE DIRECTED TO MUNICIPAY, SERVICES AT 630-353-8105

Submitied by: Rag's Electric Company
Vendor Name: Rag's Electyic Company
Address: 16244 Bluff Road Lemont, IT 60439
Date: 10-04-2012
Phone #: 630-739-7247 fax #: 630-739-7424
E-mail Address: ragselectric@aal.com)
Anthorized Signature: AT
—
Quote Amounni: M(Totﬂ for a1l 3-Plants) é;&s, 269

Quote Amount in Writing: _ Thirty Twe Thousand Six-Hundred.Dollars and no/100.

The vendor shall provide thiree references with phone numbers below:

1. Village of Hodgkins - #708-579-6700
2 Village of Lemont - #630-257-2532
3. City of Darien - #630-B52-5000

Accepiance of Quote:

By: Dale:
City of Darien

Authorized and Accepted:

By:

Title;

Date: - . e e




Incorporated 18989

September 18, 2012

The City of Darien is soliciting for competitive quotes for Electrical Maintenance Housekeeping
at several of the City’s water facility stations. The housekeeping includes the removal of
ebsolete electrical equipment and components for the facilities located at Plant 3-1930 Manning
Road, Plant 4-1897 Manning Road and Plant 5-8700 block of Lemont Road. The housekeeping
is required due to the removal of sofiening and well equipment from when the City converted to
Lake Michigan water.

The scope of work shall include the following:

A. Plant 3-1932 Mannping Roead
Furnish and install the necessary electrical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
panels and transfer switch and replace with new metering and panels as outlined below:

1. Remove exisiing 200-ampere main switch.
2. Remove existing generator transfer switch.
3. Rework existing chlorine and starter and rework CL.2 wiring to new panel.
4. Remove existing transformer.
5. Remove (1) abandoned well starter and wiring back io junction box at wall.
6. Fumish and install (1) 200-ampere main C/B with C/B’s for reconneeted equipment.
The panel shall have 6 spare circuil breaker spaces/blanks for fature.
= 7. Furnish and install}(1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.
8. Refeed existing 120/208 vol panel.
9. Grouond service and transformer per code.

Material Cost $__2,950.00 ;I!abo/ -
P
Labor Cost §  4,950.00 'f,(pOD
-~
Plant 3 Total Cost $  7.980700 LoD
-

B. Plant 4-1897 Manping Road

Furnish and instal] the necessary elecirical materials and labor 10 remove existing 480-volL
motor control center and replace it with new metering and panel as outlined below:

1. Remove 5=section'molor contro) center. o :

2. Furnish and install new 480-volt 200-amp Com-Ed-meier on exterior of building, -

L S T

1702 Plainfield Road | Darien, llinois BOS5681 | Ares B30 | 852-5000

In the County of DF—'—'age and the State of Ilhncals

EILLE Fod s - B i, e w
AR L R R




Clectricnl Maintenance Housekeeping
September 18,2012

Page 2

Furnish and install new 3-phase 4-W 480-volt panel board with (1) 60A 3-pole C/B.
Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208 volt transformer.

Furnish and install (1) 125-amp main C/B panel and circuit breakers to reefed 120~
volt circuits as required. The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker spaces/blanks
for future.

6. Disconnect and remove cireuits related to old pump station

7. Existing conduit shall be utilized.

il ol o

Material Cost $ 3,830.00 3,900
g
Labor Cost b (.3} 2200 $,2007
Plant 4 Total Cost 3 1036000 §760”
C. §600 Lemont Road

Furnish and instail the necessary electrical materials and labor to remove the existing 480V
motor control center and replace it with a new metering and panels as owlined below:

P 0319

8.
9.

Remaove existing (4) section motor control center.

Remove existing pump conirol panel.

Remove (3) existing feeders from motor control center to Com-Ed transformer.
Rework (1) feeder to new C/T cabinet and pull new wire from C/T to Com-Ed
transformer.

Furpish and instalt a 400-ampere C/T meter cabinet with remote meter on exterior
building.

Fumnish and install (1) 400-ampere main C/B panel with C/B’s to power existing circuits
that are to remain,

Furnish and instal! (1) 125 ampere main C/B panel with the necessary C/B’s to power
existing circuits that will remain. The panel shall have 6 spare circuit breaker
spaces/blanits for future.

Remove all circuits that are no longer required.

Furnish and install (1) 45-kva 480/208V transformer.

10. Ground ﬂemce and transformer.

Material Cost 3 5;7 -00 (,\lau"
Labor Cost $ 7,850700 L1060~

Plant 5 Total Cost $__ 18,686700 12,900
General;

The vendor may be required to perform additional tasks that ma‘y be unforeseen. Any

... exiraordinary e.xpenses shall be paid for, as followsio ... o . o seepmermee




Electrical Maintensnce Housekeeping
September 18, 2012
Pape 3

Material-Invoice + 15%- No tax

Hourly Labor Rates:
Electrician hY 90.00
Electricians Helper 5 50.00

Al exiraordinary tasks shall not require more than 2 people. If required, anthorization shall be
required for more than 2 people. All extra work shall be approved prior {o commencement of
work.

General notes:

1. All permit costs required by the City shall be waived.

2. The awarded vendor shall provide a copy of their elecixical license with the bid and proof
of a certificate of insurance.

3. Al work shall be in accordance with the 2005 National Elecirical Code.

4. A scheduled pre-bid walk through has been scheduled for Sept 25, 2012 at 8:30 am

at Plant 3-loeated 3 block north of Plainfield Road a¢ 1930 Manning Rd. See

attached map. The pre bid walicthroungh is NOT mandatory and will not hold any

additional walkthroughs after said date.

All equipment shall be Square D-no exceptions

City will dispose of all discarded equipment

All panels shall be clearly labeled and identified

All outages shall be scheduled by the awarded vendor

g e

The project is anticipated to begin by November 7, 2012 and completed by December 20, 2012.
Sealed quotes will be accepted until Ociober 4, 2012, until the hour of 10:00 a.m. Quotes shall
be opened and read aloud at 10:00 am at the City of Darien, 1702 Plainfield Road-upstairs
Conference Room. Sealed quotes may be mailed or delivered to the City of Darien at 1702
Plainfield Road and clearly marked as Elecirical Maintenance-Water Facilities, ATTN: Ashley
Prueter. -

Any and all requests or addendums shall be made in writing to the atiention of the Director of
Municipal Services via fax or e-mail to 630-852-4709 or dgombac{@darienil.gov. All requests
will be responded 1o within 48 hours fo all bidders on file.




AGENDA MEMO
Municipal Services Committee
October 22,2012

ISSUE STATEMENT

A resolution to enter into a contract agreement with Homer Tree Care, Inc. in an amount not to
exceed $94,000.00 for the City's 2012/13 Tree Trimming and Removal Program.

BACKGROUND/HISTORY

The proposed contract is the 1* of 2 option extensions. The 2011/12 Tree Trimming and Removal
contract was awarded to Steve Piper and Sons on November 7, 2011, Res. No R-87-11 with two
optional year contract extensions.

Recently, staff had reached out to Steve Piper and Sons regarding the 1st year extension. The owner
Steve Piper had notified the City that they were not interested in the extension. See attached e-mail
correspondence labeled as Attachment 1.

The staff had reviewed the original bid tally, see Attachment 2, and identified that Homer Tree Care,
Inc. was the next responsive bidder. Homer Tree Care, Inc. was requested to review the bid and
honor the pricing as proposed by Steve Piper and Sons for the 2012/13 program. Upon negotiations,
Homer Tree Care agreed to honor the pricing with the exception to the hourly rate for Emergency
Tree Removal. See Attachment 3 for the negotiated unit pricing for this year’s program. Staff had
also extended the invitation for price matching to Powell Tree Care and Winkler’s Tree Service and
both had declined to price match, see Attachments 4 and 5.

The proposed tree trimming program consists of trimming approximately 1,953 parkway trees, 35
tree removals and stump grinding. The removals were identified during the inventory process during
2012. Please note, staff anticipates that Ash trees will be identified for removal during the year.
Below are the areas to be trimmed:

Farmingdale Village Subdivision
Woodmere Subdivision

Tara Hill Subdivision

Carriage Green #4 Subdivision
Carriage Hill Subdivision
Darien Woods Subdivision
Waterfall Glen Subdivision

This year’s program also includes contract pricing for the Private Property Tree Trimming Program
to all the residents. The program would allow residents to have their private property trees trimmed
or removed and stump grinding at the residents expense. The trimming will include removal of
perished, diseased, interfering, and weak branches, as well as removal of under branches as
requested. The bid included unit prices for Private Property Tree Trimming that would be paid for
directly by the residents. The bid price for the Private Property tree trimming is $65.00 per tree in the
front yard and $140.00 per tree in the back yard. The contract also includes unit pricing for private
property tree removal, and stump grinding.




2012 Tree Trimming Program
October 22, 2012

Page 2
2012 City of Darien Tree Removal Schedule
UNIT

DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY PRICE COST

Tree Trimming Each 1,953 34.00 | $ 66,402.00

Tree Removal per DBH Per Inch 500 30.00 | § 15,000.00

Misc Stump Removal Each 35 70.00 | § 2,450.00

Tree Trimming Program Cost $ 83,852.00
Contingency-Ash Tree Removals

Ash Tree Removal per DBH Per Inch 141.60 30.00 | § 4,248.00

Ash Tree Stump Removal Each 10 90.00 | § 900.00

Ash Tree Removal Costs $ 5,148.00
Contingency-Tree Removal &

Stump Grinding $ 5,000.00
Contingency-Emergency Storm

Hazards Per Hr 75 $ 200.00 | $ 15,000.00
The proposed expenditure would be expended from the following accounts:
ACCOUNT ACCOUNT FY 12/13 | EXPENDITURE PROPOSED PROPOSED
NUMBER DESCRIPTION BUDGET TO DATE EXPENDITURE | BALANCE

TREE TRIMMING

01-30-4375 | & REMOVAL $112,702.00 $ 4,852.00 $ 9400000 | $13,850.00
STAFF RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends approval of a resolution awarding a contract to Home Tree Care, Inc. in an
amount not to exceed $94,000.00 for the City's 2012/13 Tree Trimming and Removal Program.

ALTERNATE DECISION

Not approving the contract.

DECISION MODE

This item will be placed on the November 5, 2012 City Council agenda for formal consideration.




Attachment 1
Ashley Prueter

From: ban Gombac

Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2012 2:32 PM
To: Steve Piper

Cc: Bryon Vana; Dan Salvato; Ashley Prueter
Subject: RE: 201213 Tree Trimming Extension
Steve:

Thank you for your commenits, unfortunately | disagree with your statement that the trees are not representative from
last year's work/contract. Again, thank you and pending our decision we look forward to working with you in the future.

Dautel Goumbae

Dinecton of Weaniccpal Senuices

630-355- §106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIGECT CONNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!

http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html

From: Steve Piper [mailto:steve@stevepiperandsons.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2012 2:16 PM

To: Dan Gombac
Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

The trees in this section are not representative of the trees in last years contract and the way the contract is written there
is no size categories, therefore we are required to trim this year (12/13) for the same average price as last year and there
is not enough money in the contract to cover the trees this year.

From: Dan Gombac [mailto:dgombac@darienil.qov]
Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2012 2:51 PM

To: Steve Piper

Cc: Bryon Vana; Ashley Prueter

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Is there a specific reason?
Daiel Gombace

Dinector of Wanicipal Sevvceee
650-3555- 8106




To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIRECT CONNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
hitp://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN

ews.html

From: Steve Piper [mailto:steve@stevepiperandsons.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2012 11:54 AM

To: Dan Gombac

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

We are not able to except the tree trimming contract extension for the 2012/2013 year—sorry
Steve Piper & Sons, Inc.

Steve Piper

President

P 430.898 6050 = 104

F 430898 5141
stevefilstevepiperandrons €om
wwerstevepiperandsons com

From; Dan Gombac [mailto:dgombac@darienil.gov]
Sent: Friday, September 28, 2012 9:11 AM

To: Steve Piper

Cc: Ashley Pruster :

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Hi Steve:

| apologize for the delay. Ashley will be forwarding you the proposed section for trimming. | request that you get back to
me by Oct 11.

Thank you,

Daciet q&mﬂd&

Dereetor of Wanieisal Seruces

630-353- 5106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

BIER DIRECT CONNECT




Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!

http://www.darien.il.us/Depariments/Administration/CityN
ews.hitml

From: Steve Piper [mailto:steve@stevepiperandsons. com)
Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2012 3:26 PM

To: Dan Gombac

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Hi Dan

Before we can make a decision on the contract, we would like to know the areas that the city is going to have us trim.

From: Dan Gombac [mailto:dgombac@darienil.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2012 4:45 PM

To: Steve Piper (steve@stevepiperandsons.com)
Cc: Ashley Prueter; Dan Salvato

Subject: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Good afternoon Steve:

City Staff is inquiring to whether you are willing to accept the 1* contract extension for the upcoming tree program.
Program same as last year.

Two items that we need to agree on is the deadline for residents to call in for tree trimming. My thought was no later
than Feb 28 2013

The payment arrangements for the private tree trimming/removal. Will the policy be upfront payment?
Please let me know if there are any other issues that we need to address.

Committee approval request Oct 22, followed by City Council Nov 5.

Daucel Gombac

Denecton of Municctal Sewiced

630-353- §106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIRECT CORNNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html




(1 uo|sIan) saan-LLI0) B)|NSaY pig - Z UDBIW\UOEIuaWNDo Bunioddng\z L0g 22 Jaqoio\sepliaby SHIopA 2liand\:d

D5°89t'16 % OCZIT'L8 8 0E'H06'ZR § 00'S01'8L S 00'S01'8L § 00°S01'8L S D% €V SNOLLDES - TV.IOL
00°096TI % | 00'F2E & | 00°00F'TI § | 00°0TE | 00°000°ZTI § | OOO0E § 00°00Z'c § [ 00'0ET % | D0TGOT'S § | 00°0ET S| 0000C'S $ | O0OET $ | 00°0F 5aA1AISE Aauadiawmy
006IET § [ 006IETS | 00°EBZ'L § | OU'EBT'I$ § D0'SET'T § | 00°CET'TE 0O°S6I°T % [ 00°SAT'T $ | 00°S61'T § | OO'SAI'TS | 00'S6I'L § | 0O'S6IT1S € uonaag - Moy
00602 S| 0060 §[0090T §|}0090C §|0000C & |0000C § oo'sie ${00ciz S ]00SeT §|O0GLE § | 00SLE F[00SLT § |1 yanyg Womgl-aurpuny) dumg
0060r $|00601 % [O00E0T §[00€0l §)00001 § 000001 § 00°0€T % {000ST § {00051 &|o00St % |000SE £ [0005T § (I navg juer-SupuiD dums
0008 F| 0008 5| 00LL SlooiL gpoost  §|00GL % 0066 $700S6  $Jj00s6 E|o0°c6 S[00C6  §|00%6 &I oup Jad [AVE) [ 1d [paoway 8aLL
006E $[(006E $|00LE S| O0LE SO0CSE  §|00EE § 000t  ${000E ${00DE  $|000c S |000E §|000E S|t yoi] 13 [JU0L]} HE( 190 [BADWAY 8311
00609 S| 00609 %{00SeS § | 00685 § | 00SLE  F|O0CLS ¥ 000sy  $jooosy $|ooosy $|o00St B 000sF % | 000Sy § |1 yavg PIBA Houg-TuiuIulL] 331
ODELE % |00ELT §{00%9C §|00GOC $[0D0ST & | 0005 § 00s6l  S{o0sar § 0056l § | 00°S61 | 00'c6l $ | 00°S6l $ |1 g PIA juoLl-Sulniiy, aas)
180D FDNd 180D oNid LSOO Jondd 180D HORId L8500 q20Ud 180D H0rdd SLING LINM NOLLAMDS3A

TVIOL 1IN TY.LOL LINT TVIOL LINM TV101 LINN TV.LOL LINM TV.LOL LINO  |J350d0Ud
0S6R1°LL S EOEBT § | 0S6TVELS | EOFLT § [ 05°699°69 % [ £0°LOT § OOOELILS [ TI'I9C S P O0DILTILS | EE'19C § [ 000ILTLE | 2l'19E § ¥ uonpasg - [woigqns
00’0861 $ {0066 §)000T6’T $| 0096 §|00098'1 $[(00€6 § 00'00S°€ §§O0'SLY  $}0000S'S %[ O0SL] §|00rOps'e % | 00SLl $ | OC yawg HAOULSY duns Js1A
OTHIY S| Triy S |O0THE'E S| E6E B | 0DERLE | THLE % 00000 §|O000S S| 00000°C $|000S § 000000 $[000S $|O01 youp 1a Heq Jad [aoutay 321,
05L90° 1L S | 190 5[ 0S°L9SL0F | 198§ | 0S'LS0°t9 % | 199 § goorcey s | er9E  sfoo0iTess [ 2o % | 00°01g€9s | 9 $ | 05L) foug Huruwi g, 331

L1802 dONd LSOO HOTud 1802 HA0Ndd 1800 Honid LS0D HOTdd 150D H300dd SLINN LINM NOLLJIMOS3ad
TY.LOL JINM TVY.LOL LINM TV.LOL LINM TVLOL LINN TVIOL LINN BLATSAR LINM [ GHSOdOUd
PLOT/EIOT ET10T/EI0L Iag/1ioe Fioz/etoe £10T/Z108 210e/1102 AR JUISLE
PAJ1 WINPU3PPY/PUCE PADI WINPURPPY/PUDH | pADl WINpUSppy/puog PADI WNPUIPRY/PUOE pAdl WNPUAppY/puog PADI WINPUIPPY/pucyg Lvanpieg udrug jo 41D
B0IAIDS D21, JOPUITA, 30IAIDE DALf, DPIEA 2014105 231, I3P{ULM a7 2311 [[amod 8180 D2I], om0 M) 931 |13MO]

T IRWIeN Y

ONIDMMd ANV HOONIA-TILYILODIANTY UVHA (NT
we 000l 180T ‘81 99010 HINLL/ALVA ONINIJO

winBoly Bupmup § 821, 1107 19 A9TVES




{1 UDISIaA) ssal-LIIC) SYNSEY PIF - 2 UDBIVUOREjUSLLINao Builoddngyg L0z 22 1aqoiooisepuaby S3IoA oHand\:d

0009028 $ 00'0EEBLS 00009 LS 00°860°69 § 0086069 § 00'860°69 8 D% d 'V SNOLLOFS - TVI0L
00000118 | 00'SLZS | 00005018 | 05°29¢$ | 00°000°01 $ | 00'0STS 000077 § | 000I1S | 0000FY S| O0OLES | 0000FF § | 000118 | 00'0F Se0IAJag AaUatIatI
00°c6b & | DUSGYS | 05cih & | 0SZLvS | 0005k  § | 00°0SPS OOBEE & | 00°'86ES | 00'B6E S | O0'BGES | 00°'B6E  § | 00'B6ES £ G05035 - [BI0Nqng
0066  §| 00665 |0S¥6 S|05¥6 § | 0006 S |00068S 00SL S| 00GL S |008L S O0SLS|00SL & |00SL§ |l OELE Noeg-SUIpUHD g
0066 S |0066 §|05¥6 S |05¥6 $ |0006 S| 0006 % 0005 $ 0005 §[0008 S |000s 8| 0008  $|000S § |1 [EER] WoIT-BuIpuRn dimg
0TIz | 0SLT $|S29C $]cc9z §5|00ST S| 00SC § Goov S |000r $|000F S |00GF §|000F §|000F § |1 You[ 1o | (oUH) HAQ 90 [EA0LIaY aal]
00cc 8| 00CC §|001C  $|001Z §|000c & | 000 § 008 5|008C §|008C S |00SZ §|008C & | 00BE § 1 (o[ 187 | (F004:1) HEQ J50 [pA0Way ai],
D0SIL % | 00SOIS | 0SS 81 OSZSIS | 000ST S | 000SIS DO0OFT  § | 000FIS | 000F1 S | GOOPIS | 000PL 8 | 00°0FIS |1 v P4 SOUG-UIUIIL 391,
05C8  §|0S78 §|SL8L S| SLSL §|00SL S|O0SLS 00S9  § 0059 $|0059  S§|00S9 §|00€9 §|00%9 § 1 GETE] PIEA TuoIJ-Sumnup] 931
1S00 | 40t | IS00 | dordd | 1S0D | AORId IS00 | @omdd | 1S00 | #omid | ISO0 | #0md | SLINA | XINN NOILITE053a
TVIOL | LINQ | Tviol | Imn | 1viol | 1iNn 101 | IINn | TvioL | 1IN | TVIOL | LINA |QHSOdOYd
0GOS OLS | 000ITS | 05LSELOS | OD'SOLS | 00°0STF9S | 00001 0000EF9 S | 00 PSIS | O0O0ETIS | DOFSIS | OD00ET9S | 00 FSIS V UOIaas - [B101GNS
00066 S| 05GP | 00SKG S| ScLt $ | 00006 §|00St § 000087 S 0006 § | 000081 S| 0006 § | 000081 § | 0006 S| 0T [EF] TEAOLISY, QUM OSTA]
0000ZC | 00ZC | 00D0IC 8| O0IZ § | 000007 § | 000 § D0O00E § | ODOE $ | 00'000E § | 00O § | 00000E § | OG'0E § | 00T U] 35d HEQ $od [BA0WaY 881,
Q0SLELOG |OCRE § | 06 CIEPIS | SLOE § | 00°05C 198 | BOSE § 00°00SGES | 0OPE § | 0000SGES | O0FE § | 000056SS | O0FE § | 0SL T o UL aa1],
IS0D | @orad | IS0 | @ordd | 1SOo | dordd 1500 | 90nud | 1S00 | domid | 1s00 | 80mud | SLINO | LINA NOLLINOSEd
TYIOL | LINQ | 7Tviol | XN | 1viOL | IINn TVIOL | LINn | TVIOL | 1NN | 7TVIOL | LINN |Q3sodoud

FI0Z/ET0Z E10/210T ZI0T110E FI0Z/E10T €10C/2 10T ZI0T/T10C dgax (wasty
_u>nE wmpusppy/pucqg pAQ LMPUDPRY/pUoY _u>n_u E:ﬂzvﬁﬁ<\ﬁnom PALI UMPLUAPEY PUOE] ﬁ>n_..— E:bzmﬁv<\ﬂnom pAat Eﬁtcuﬁ_u{....tncm .hﬁ}ﬁ_hﬁ.m =u_.-aa Jo _ﬁ._u
2By 2al] Jatuo] 2187y 921 130 are) 9al], JaWoH suog 7 Jadig aA3S SU0S 29 Jadl] 2A3IS su0g 7 Jadid eAmg

T YUY

we 00:01 110T 81 490100 HNILALYA DNINGJO

wrerdosg Supusiny sa1y [[0T dIE qATVIS




(1 uoIsian) saal-Liio) SYNSayY pig - € Yoenwuonejuawnoog BulpoddnsizLOg 22 Jeqoipoisepuaby syiopA Dilandyd

00009t § Hildld TATLS ANV HHIWOH NIIMLAE ESVHAIONI LIN
00°869°TL § 00'0ER'SL § 00'860'69 § oseili’eg % 00'SOT'8L § 0% €'V SNOILDHIS - TV.LOL
000008 S| 00°00Z S |000008 $(0000C $]0000¥+ $|00°0TT §|00°00+'T1 $|O000IE $|00002°S §|O00EL § | 000F sadjAlag Aouagiowy
00°86€ $| 0086 S|oszLy $|0STLh ${00°86E  $ | 0086E S | D0ERCT1 S| 00°E8T'T & | 00'SKI°L $ | 00'S6TTS g Uopaag - [mogng
00'sL S100°SL §05F6 $|0cv6 § | 00SL $|00sL § | 0090T S| 0090 $]o00siz $|0U0SLZ §|I yaeyg Yorg-Fulpuup dwms
I £|10008 8 |0SP6 glosre % | O0FOS S§lo0c0s 8 | 00°EOL % 00E0T % {00051 & |000ST § |I yaeg Juo1-Fuipups dwmg
00'0¥ $|000F §STOT gHET9C  $|00°0F gio000F §j00°LL §lo0LL §10056 $(o0se ${1 youp 1ag [3oeg) HEAJ 42d [BAOWAY 311
00°8¢ $1008T S |00 gio01c $) 0082 $1008 §;00LE $|o00Le  §)000E g|loooe $1 you] Jad PuoLf) HEQ 426 [BAOWSY 3311
00’0t 1000001 S|OSLEL $[OSLEL $|0000PT 5 00°0FT 5| 00°S6S §|ooses $|000sr F|000sF 3|1 naeyq PIB & joeg-SUIWWHL, 3311
0nsg $10059 S| SL8L FSLBL %0059 51009 5009 Sloosor $]|00S61  §{00%T $|1 yory Pl A JUOLI-BUUNILLL 931
L8S0D HOd 180D HOldd 1S0D T2Hd | LSOD TVIOL FOIdd LSOO d0Tdd SLINI JLIND NOILLdTI2S3d
TYLOL LIND TYLOL LINM TVLOL LIND LINM V101 LINO | AISOd0OUd
00°00E'%9 § | 00°PST S| OSLSELOS [ 00°S0L S| 00'00E'r9 § | 00'pST S | 0S6EPEL § | €OPLL  $ | O0OILILS | CI'I9C § ¥ uohoag - [Bogng
00°008'T S|0006 & |00SP6 §|STLF S| 0D008'T $| 0006 | 00061 %0096 $|o00005t $]00SL1 §|0C yanyg [uAotiay dwmg asiA
00°000°c S| 00'CE 5| 0000I'T $|00°1C $|00000°c §|000€ % |00CTHe'E §$|er6e  $|00°000°C $}000S & | 001 gauf Jag HEQ Jad [eAOWY 234,
00'005'65 | 00'€ | OSTIEPOS [SL'OE & | 00°00S'65$ [ 00°PE & | 0529529 §|I198€  § | 00°0ITE9S [ TI'9E  § | 0SL°1 yaeyq SupunupL] 9911
LSOO 24 LS00 IOoTdd LSOO HORIE | LS00 TVLOL HOTdad 180D HONAd S.LINMN LINCL NOILLTIDS3A
TYLOL kAL ELAREND LINN TV.LOL LIN JIND TVILOL LINM | GIS0d0¥d
£I0T/TI6T £10T/210¢ CHOZ/TIOT £10Z/T10T £10T/T10T AU A IS

318Dy 294 ], SO

2le)) 921 JOWOH

suog %y a1 249315

20lAlag 931, JAUIA

arm)) 231], [[amod

QILYLLODANHY

Avavping maLieq jo A3

€ JmPunpPERY

HNIDTId ANV HOAONTA-GILVILODUNTI NOISNILXT LOVHAILNOD DNIIWATYL T34 1 HVAA ANT




Attachment 3

Ashley Prueter

From: Dan Gombac

Sent: Wednesday, Octaber 10, 2012 2:25 PM
To: Mike Fitzpatrick

Ce: Rich Reposh; Bryon Vana; Ashley Prueter
Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Thanks Mike also please forward Sheryl’s email address.

Daiel Gonbac

Derector of Wanicifal Services

650-353- 5106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIRECT CONNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html

From: Mike Fitzpatrick [mailto:mike@homertree.com]
Sent: Wednesday, Octobher 10, 2012 10:44 AM

To: Dan Gombac; Rich Reposh

Cc: Sheryl Leslie

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

| believe everything is in order Dan
Thanks again for the opportunity and don't hesitate to call our office with any further questions or concerns

Sheryl will be the office contact for us
We look forward to the next few years working in Darien

Best regards

Mike Fitzpatrick

Chief Operaling Officer
Homer Tree Care, Inc.

14000 S. Archer Ave.
Lockport, IL 60441

Office: 815-838-0320

Fax; 815-838-0375
www.facebook com/homertree

From: Dan Gombac [majlte:dgombac@darienii.qov]
Sent: Tuesday, October 09, 2012 5:19 PM
To: Rich Reposh; Mike Fitzpatrick




Cc: Bryon Vana; Ashley Prueter; Dan Salvato
Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Good afternoon Gentiemen:

Thank you for meeting with me this afternoon regarding the 2012/13 Tree Trimming Contract. The following items were
discussed:

1. Homer Tree will honor the pricing for the 2™ year Tree Trimming Contract extension at the prices submitted by
Steve Piper and Sons, with the following exception;

The rate for Emergency Services has been negotiated to $200.00 per hour, between the hours of 7:00am and
5:00pm and $300 per hour between the hours of 5:00pm and 7:00am.

2. Private Property Trimming-Residents will have the opportunity to contract with Homer Tree at the unit prices as
submitted by Steve Piper and Sons for the 2™ year extension. The residents will contact Homer Tree directly
between December 1, 2012 and by no later than Feb 15, 2013. The residents will be billed by Homer Tree after
the work is completed and the residents will submit payment. The resident trimming will be completed by Feb
28, 2013.

3. Acertificate of insurance and a 5% hond will be required.

The City Staff will present the Tree Trimming Contract to Municipal Services Committee Meeting scheduled for
Oct 22, 2012 and City Council on Nov 5, 2012, Please confirm the above understanding and if there are any
additional questions or comments let me know. A revised unit price will be forwarded.

Sincerely,

Daaiel Gombac

Derector of WHunicipal Senvices

630-353 - §106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIRECT CONNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!

http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html

From: Dan Gombac

Sent: Monday, October 08, 2012 10:14 AM

To: 'Mike Fitzpatrick'

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

1702 Plainfield Road we are across the parking lot from the police dept

Daiel Gombac
Dienector of Wanteitial Services




650-555- 5106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIRECT CONNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
hitp://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html

From: Mike Fitzpatrick [mailto:mike@homertree.com]
Sent: Monday, October 08, 2012 9:45 AM

To: Dan Gombac

Cc: Rich Reposh

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extensicn

Dan Where exactly would you like us to meet with you tomorrow?

Mike Fitzpatrick

Chlef Operating Officer
Homer Tree Care, Inc.

14000 S. Archer Ave.
Lockport, IL 60441

Office: 815-838-0320

Fax: 815-838-0375
www.facebook com/homertree

From: Rich Reposh

Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2012 9:46 AM
To: Dan Gombac

Cc: Sheryl Leslie; Mike Fitzpatrick

Subject: FW: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Dan , thank you for the clarification on the specs. we want to reveiw our fall / winter work load , and make sure we are
able to provide the service that your City requires prior to the acceptance of the contract .

Richard Reposh

Certified Arborist IL-0567
Rich@homertree.com
Qffice: §15-838-0320
Fax; 815-838-0375

Cell: 815-693-4258




From: Dan Gombac [mailto:dgombac@darienil.aov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2012 5:42 AM

To: Rich Reposh

Cc: Ashley Prueter; Dan Saivato

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Good marning Rich:

In regards to the questions presented, clean-up work for the parkway removals includes grinding the stump and leaving
the grindings in an organized pile. The clean-up is limited to chips that are scattered due to the operation. Example 1,
chips are strewn onto the sidewalk or street. The sidewalk or street should be swept and chips placed on the stumped
pile area. Example 2, chips are scattered ouiside the grinding area. An effort must be made to rake chips to the stump
ground pile. The City will be responsible for removing the chips and restoration.

Pending your response, the Staff would present the agreement to our Municipal Services Committee on Oct 22, followed
by a Nov 5 City Council meeting. The trimming would be scheduled to begin the first two weeks in Dec or as agreed upon
and completed by Feb, pending weather. The removals should be completed by the end of March, unless the
circumstance poses an immediate safety concern. The schedule is flexible, provide that we are all in agreement with
dates.

In regards to the private property portion we would need to establish a time frame for residents to sign up by.

Thanks

Daucel Gombac

Denector of Wanicipal Senvices

630-353 - §106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DARIEN DIRECT CONNECT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.htm|

From: Rich Reposh [mailto:rich@homertree.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2012 8:03 AM
To: Dan Gombac

Cc: Sheryi Leslie

Subject: RE: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Gooedmorning Mr Gombac , | hope this email finds you happy and well , Question | what are the cleanup specs. for

parkway stump removal on you contract .and when exactly are you folks thinking of getting this work underway , our
schedule is very fuli and very tight.

Richard Reposh

Certified Arborist IL.-0567
Rich@homertree.com
Office: 815-838-0320




Fax: 815-838-0375
Cell: 815-693-4258

From: Dan Gombac [mailto:dgombac@darienil.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2012 4:09 PM

To: Rich Reposh

Cc: Ashley Prueter; Bryon Vana; Dan Salvato
Subject: FW: 2012/13 Tree Trimming Extension

Good afternoon Richard:

Our awarded tree trimming vendor, Steve Piper and Sons has declined the contract extension slated for Dec 1, 2012
through 2013. Homer Tree was the second lowest bidder and we are requesting Homer to review the bid to meet the
2012/13 unit pricing for Steve Piper and Sons.

Also attached are the limits of the proposed trimming section and includes approx. 1800 trees for trimming and slated
for removal are approx. 400 inches to date. Please note that the contract includes private property trimring. Thank you
for your consideration.

Please let me know by no later than Oct 11.

Ashley, please scan and farward a copy of the contract for Homer.

Dautel Gombac

Deineeton of Wlancecal Servcces

650-355- 5106

To receive important information from the City of Darien sign up for
our electronic newsletter:

DATTEN DIRECT COMNEDT

Follow the link below and subscribing is simple!
http://www.darien.il.us/Departments/Administration/CityN
ews.html




Attachment 4
Ashley Prueter

From: PowellTreeCare@aol.com

Sent: Monday, October 15, 2012 2:23 PM
To: Ashley Prueter

Subject; Re: City of Darien

Hi Ashley:

After thoroughly reviewing the projected trimming areas for 2012 7 2013, and the bid tabs from 2011 / 2012, David Powell
has stated that while he would be willing to extend our pricing for the parkway trees from the 2011 / 2012 bid, he can not
possibly meet Piper's pricing. We may have some room to negotiate our parkway tree pricing if we have the capability of
quoting the residential work on a per job basis.

I don't know why Piper opted not to renew this contract, but with the gas price increases, drive time, insurance premiums
and our current work load due to local EAB infestations we just can't possibly afford to meet their rates. I'm sure that you
are finding that concurrent across the board. Since we were the third highest on this bid, we figure that you have already
contacted Homer, and will probably reach out to Winkler next,

I'm sorry that we are not able to assist you with the offer as stated, but we do very much appreciate you contacting us,
Ashley. Please let us know if you are interested in exploring our counter option. Otherwise, please let us know if you
will have to put this back out to bid again this year. Thank you, and best of luck.

Very Best Regards,

Lisa Powell
Powell Tree Care, Inc.

In a message dated 10/11/2012 8:49:14 A.M. Central Daylight Time, aprueter@darienil.gov writes:

Attached is the map of the area for trimming/removals. | am forwarding your questions to Dan Gombac so he
can answer them for you.

Ashley Prueter
City of Darien

(630) 353-8105

From: PoweliTreeCare@aol.com [mailto:PowellTreeCare@aol.com i
Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2012 6:34 PM

To: Ashley Prueter
Subject: Re: City of Darien

Hi again, Ashley:




I just pulled our file from the original bid for 2011 /2012. Although | have not had a chance to completely read
through the specs again, | noticed that there was a map included in that bid packet that depicted the areas where
the work was to take place for the 2011 / 2012 season.

David wanted me to let you know that we are definitely interested in looking at the possibility of doing this work
for you. Before making any definitive decisions, he would very much like to take a look at the trees to be
timmed or removed in the areas that you are planning to address for the 2012 / 2013 season. As such, we are
wondering if you have those areas mapped out at this point, and if you could provide us with a copy of that map.
As David would prefer to physically see the projected areas, we are also wondering if there is any way that you
could extend your answer deadline until the beginning of next week so that he has time to do some research on
the trees in question.

Also, we were wondering what your time constraints may be for this project? January, February and/or March
would be an ideal time for us to perform this type of work for you, if that would work within your timing
requirements,

Thanks again, Ashley. | will look forward to hearing back from you. If the map can not be emailed, please feel
free to fax it to me at (847) 364-1185, or you can send it via courier at our expense if necessary.

Best Regards,
Lisa Powell

Powell Tree Care, Inc.

In 2 message dated 10/10/2012 4:11:02 P.M. Central Daylight Time, aprueter@darienil.gov writes:

David,

The City of Darien recently reached out to Steve Piper & Sons to extend the tree
trimming/removal contract for 2012-2013. They unfortunately declined the extension. The
City is now reaching out to Powell Tree Care to see if you would meet Steve Piper & Sons
rates for 2012-2013, see attached rate sheet. Please respond by 11 a.m. on October 12, 2012.

Thank you for your consideration.




Attachment 5

Ashley Prueter

From: Winkiers Tree Service [info@winklerstreeservice.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 16, 2012 10:35 AM

To: Ashley Prueter

Subject: RE: City of Darien

Good Morning Ashley,

| received your email and request regarding tree trimming/remaval contract for 2012-2013. | would be able perform the
work for the City of Darien at the prices we bid. Unfortunately, | would not be able to do the work at Steve Piper & Sons
rates. If you would be agreeable to having Winkler's Tree Service perform the work at ourrates, please let me know.

Thank you for the opportunity to be of service.

Vince Winkler

From: Ashley Prueter [mailto:aprueter@darienil.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, October 16, 2012 10:35 AM

To: info@winklerstreeservice.com
Subject: FW: City of Darien

Vince,

Since | have not heard from you, | thought | would reach out to see if you are able to meet Steve Piper’s rates. Please let
me know asap.

Ashley Prueter
City of Darien
(630) 353-8105

From: Ashley Prueter

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2012 4:16 PM
To: 'Info@winklerstreeservice.com'

Subject: City of Darien

Vince,

The City of Darien recently reached out to Steve Piper & Sons to extend the tree trimming/removal contract for 2012-
2013. They unfortunately declined the extension. The City is now reaching out to Winkler Tree Service to see if you

would meet Steve Piper & Sons rates for 2012-2013, see attached rate sheet. Please respond by 11 a.m. on October 12,
2012,

Thank you for your consideration.
Ashley Prueter

City of Darien
(630) 353-8105




RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION TO AUTHORIZE THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK TO ENTER
INTO A CONTRACT AGREEMENT FOR THE TREE TRIMMING AND REMOVAL
PROGRAM BETWEEN THE CITY OF DARIEN AND HOMER TREE CARE, INC. IN

AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $94,000.00 FOR PARKWAY TREE MAINTENANCE

TRIMMING AND AUTHORIZING THE PROPOSED UNIT PRICING FOR TREE

REMOVAL AND STUMP GRINDING

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE
COUNTY, ILLINQOIS, as follows:

SECTION 1: The City Council of the City of Darien hereby authorizes the Mayor and City
Clerk to enter into a Contract Agreement for the tree trimming and removal program between the
City of Darien and Homer Tree Care, Inc in an amount not to exceed $94,000.00 for parkway tree
maintenance trimming and authorizing the proposed unit pricing for tree removal and stump
grinding, a copy of which is attached hereto as “Exhibit A”,

SECTION 2: This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and
approval as provided by law.

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE COUNTY,
ILLINOIS, this 5" day of November 2012,

AYES:
NAYS:
ABSENT:

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE COUNTY,
ILLINOIS, this 5" day of November 2012.

KATHLEEN MOESLE WEAVER, MAYOR
ATTEST:

JOANNE E. RAGONA, CITY CLERK

APPROVED AS TO FORM

CITY ATTORNEY




Vendor Information

Exhibit A

The project is scheduled for a December 5, 2012 start date, and to be completed by no later than
March 1, 2013. Two optional contract extensions may be considered and will be reviewed for

recommendation by November of the respective subsequent year.

TO BE COMPLETED BY VENDOR
COMPANY NAME: Homer Tree Care, Inc.

CONTACT PERSON: Richard Reposh

ADDRESS: 14000 S. Archer Avenue

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: _ Lockport, IL 60441

TELEPHONE NUMBER:  Office_815-838-0320

Mobile 815-693-4258

FACSIMILE NUMBER: 815-838-0375

E-MAIL ADDRESS _Rich@homer

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE:

heryl@homertree.com

30




CITY OF DARIEN CONTRACT

This Contract is made this 18th day of October 2012 by and between the
City of Darien (hercinafer referred to as the “CITY™) and Homer_Tree Care, Inc.

(hereinafter referred to as the “CONTRACTOR™).

WITNESSETH

In consideration of the promises and covenants made herein by the CITY and the
CONTRACTOR  (hereinafter referred to collectively as the “PARTIES™), the PARTIES agree a3
follows:

SECTION 1: THE CONTRACT DOCUMENTS: This Contract shell include the

following documents (hereinafter referred to as the “CONTRACT DOCUMENTS™) however
this Contract takes precedence and controls over emy contrary provision in any of the
CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. The Coniract, including the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS,
expresses the entire agreement between the PARTIES and where it modifies, adds to or deletes
provisions in other CONTRACT DOCUMENTS; the Contract’s provisions shall prevail.
Provisions in the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS unmodified by this Contract shall be in firll force
and effect in their uneltered condition.

The Invitation to Bid

The Instructions to the Bidders

This Contract

The Tenms and Conditions

The Bid as it is responsive to the CITY"S bid requirements

All Certifications required by the City

Certificates of insurance

Performance and Payment Bonds as may be required by the CITY

SECTION 2: SCOPE OF THE WORK AND PAYMENT: The CONTRACTOR. agrees to
provide Inbor, equipment and materials necessary to provide the services as described in the
CONTRACT DOCUMENTS and further described below:

Unit Pricing for Tree Trimming, Removals and Stump Grinding within the City of Darien
and Tree Trimming, Removals and Stump Grinding for Private Properties

(Hereinafter referred to as the “WORK™) and the CITY agrees to pay the CONTRACTOR
pursuant to the provisions of the Local Government Prompt Payment Act (50 ILCS 505/1 er seq.)
the following amount for performance of the described unit prices.

SECTION 3: ASSIGNMENT: CONTRACTOR shall not assign the duties and obligations
involved in the performence of the WORK which is the subject matter of this Contract without
the writien consent of the CITY.

SECTION 4;: TERM OF THE CONTRACT: This Contract shall commence on the date of its
execution. The WORK. shall commence upon receipt of a Notice to Proceed and continue
expeditiously for 30 days from that date until final completion. This Contract shall tenminate
upon completion of the WORK, but may be terminated by either of the PARTIES for default
upon failure to cure after ten (10) days prior written notice of said default from the aggrieved
PARTY. The CITY, for its convenience, may terminste this Contract with thirty (30) days prior
written notice,

SECTION 5: INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE: The CONTRACTOR shall
indemnify and hold harmless the CITY, PARK DISTRICT, its officials, officers, directors,
agents, employees and representatives end assigns, from lawsuits, actions, costs (including
attorneys’ fees), claims or liability of any character, incurred due to the alleged neglipence of the
CONTRACTOR, brought because of any injuries or damages received or sustained by any
person, persons or property on account of any act or omission, neglect or misconduct of said
CONTRACTOR, its officers, agents and/cr employees arising out of, or in performance of any

31




of the provisions of the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS, including any claims or amounts
recovered for any infringements of patent, tmdemark or copyright; or from any clasims or
amounts arising or recovered under the "Worker's Compensation Act” or any other law,
ordinance, order or decree. In connection with any such claims, lawsnits, actions or liabilities,
the CITY, its officials, officers, directors, agents, employees, representatives and their assigns
shall have the right to defense counsel of their choice. The CONTRACTOR shall be solely liable
for all costs of such defense and for all expenses, fees, judgments, settlements and all other costs
arising out of such cleims, lawsuits, actions or lisbilities. The Contractor shall not make any
seitlement or compromise of a lawsuit or claim, or fail to pursue any available avenue of appeal
of any adverse judgment, without the approval of the City and any other indemnified party. The
City or any other indemmified party, in its or their sole discretion, shall have the option of being
represented by its or their own counsel. If this option is exercised, then the Contractor shall
promptly reimburse the City or other indemnified party, upon written demand, for any expenses,
including but not limited to court costs, reasonable atiorneys' and witnesses' fees and other
expenses of litigation incurred by the City or other indemnified party in connection therewith.
Execution of this Contract by the CITY is contingent upon receipt of Insurance Certificates
provided by the CONTRACTOR in compliance with the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.
SECTION 6: COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS: The bidder shall at all times observe and
comply with all laws, ordinences and regulations of the federal, state, local and City
governments, which mey in any manner affect the preparation of bids or the performance of the
Cantract. Bidder hereby agrees that it will comply with all requirements of the Ilinois Human
Rights Act, 775 ILCS 5/1-101 et seq,, including the provision dealing with sexual harassment
and that if awarded the Contract will not engage in any prohibited form of discrimination in
employment as defined in that Act and will require that its subcontractors agree to the same
restrictions, The contractor shall meintain, and require that its subcontractors maintain, policies
of equal employment opportunity which shall prohibit discrimination agginst any employee or
applicant for employment on the basis of race, religion, color, sex, national origin, ancestry,
citizenship status, age, marital status, physical or mental disability unrelated to the individual®s
ability to pecform the essentiel functions of the job, association with & person with a disability, or
unfavorable discharge from military service. Contrectors and all subcontractors shall comply
with all requirements of the Act and of the Rules of the Iilinois Department of Human Rights
with regard to posting information on employees’ rights under the Act. Contractors and all
subcontraciors shall place appropriate statements identifying their compsnies as equal
opportunity employers in all adverfisements for workers to be employed in work to be
performed. Not less than the Prevailing Rate of Wages as found by the City of Darien or the
Depariment of Labor shall be paid to leborers, workmen, and mechanics performing work under
the Contract. If awarded the Contract, contractor must comply with all provisions of the Iinois
Prevailing Wage Act, including, but not limited to, providing certified payrell records to the
Municipal Services Depertment. Contractor and subcontractors shall be required to comply with
all applicable federal laws, state laws and regulations regarding minimum wages, limit on
payment to minors, minimum fair wage standards for minors, payment of wage due employees,
and health and safety of employees. Contractor and subcontractor are required to pay employees
all rightful selaries, medical benefite, pension and social security benefits pursuant to applicable
labor agreements and federal and state statutes and to further require withholdings and deposits
therefore. The CONTRACTOR shall obtain all necessary local and state licenses and/or permits
that may be required for performance of the WORK and provide those licenses to the CITY prior
to commencement of the WORK if applicable.

SECTION 7: NOTICE: Where notice is required by the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

it shall be considered received if it is delivered in person, sent by registered United States mail,
return receipt requested, delivered by messenger or mail service with a signed receipt, sent by
facsimile or e~mail with an acknowledgment of receipt, to the following:

32




City of Darien

1702 Plainfield Road

Darien, I1. 60561

Atin: Director of Municipal Services _

SECTION 8: STANDARD OF SERVICE: Services shall be rendered to the highest
professional standards to meet or exceed those standards met by others providing the same or
similar services in the Chicagoland area. Sufficient competent personnel shall be provided who
with supervision shall complete the services required within the time allowed for performance.
The CONTRACTOR'S personel shall, at all times present a neat appearance and shall be
trained to handle all contact with City residents or City employees in a respectful manner, At the
request of the City Administrator or a designee, the CONTRACTOR shall replace eny
incompetent, abusive or disorderly person in its employ.

SECTION 9: PAYMENTS TO OTHER PARTIES: The CONTRACTOR shall not obligate
the CITY to make payments to third parties or make promises or representations to third parties
on behalf of the CITY without prior written approval of the City Administrator or a designee.
SECTION 10: COMPLIANCE: CONTRACTOR shall comply with all of the requirements of
the Contract Documents, including, but not limited to, the Illinois Prevailing Wage Act where
applicable and all other applicable local, state and federal siatutes, ordinances, codes, rules and
regulations.

SECTION 11: LAW AND VENUE: The laws of the State of Ilinois shall govern this Contract
and venue for legal disputes shall be DuPage County, linois.

SECTION 12: MODIFICATION: This Contract may be modified only by a written
amendment signed by both PARTIES.

FOR: THE CITY FOR: THE CONTRACTOR
By: By:;  Homer Tree Care, Inc.
Print Name: Print Name:

Richard Reposh

Title: Mayor Title: President

October 18, 2012
Date: Date

33




Schedule of Prices - 2012/13

Ttem No. Jtems Unit' | Quantity | Unit Price Total
A _ |City of Darien Program
A1l |Tree Trimming-Parkways Each 19531 § 34.00 | $66,402.00
A2 |Tree Removal cost per DBH Per Inch 100] § 30.00 | $ 3.000.00
A3 |Stump Removal Each 20| § 90.00 | § 1,800.00
Sub-Toial Al- A3 $71.202.00
B Private Property Propram
B1 _ |Tree Trimming - Front Yard Each 1] % 6500|838 65.00
B2 |Tree Trimming - Back Yard Each 11514000 { § 140.00
B3 [Tree Removal cost per DBH - Front Yard  |Per Inch 145 280018 28.00
B4 {Tree Removal cost per DBH - Back Yard Per Inch 118 4000|383 40.00
B3 _ |Stemp Grinding - Front Yard Each 1% 5000|838 50.00
B6 |Stump Grinding - Back Yard Each 118 750018 75.00
Sub-Toial Bl - B6 $ 398.00
C Emergency Services
2 man crew with operating equipment, buckat
truck and 15 cubic yurd capacity truck with a
C1 |100hp brush chipper Hourly 40| $200.00 | § 8,000.00
Total Cost Sections A, B and C $79,600.00
Bid Bond is 5% of Total Costs - Sections
A,Band C

The contract will be awarded on a Total Cost - All quantities are subject to decrease or increase.




AGENDA MEMO
Municipal Services Committee
October 22, 2012

ISSUE STATEMENT

A resolution accepting a proposal from All Star Maintenance Incorporated to provide snow
plowing and deicing services for the parking lot and walkways at the Darien Heritage Center
and the sidewalk plowing and de-icing services at the Municipal Complex as per the unit prices.

BACKGROUND

During the snow season, the department is responsible for the snow plowing and deicing
operations at the Heritage Center and the City Hall grounds. The City crews currently plow the
Municipal Complex parking lot only. Due to the required manpower for the snow plowing and
deicing operations of the City’s roadways, staff is unable to perform snow removal and/or
deicing operations for the sidewalks at the Municipal Complex and the Heritage Plaza. Some of

the costs generated for the services of Heritage Plaza are reimbursable to the City from the
tenants,

Competitive quotes were requested for snow plowing services and/or deicing services and staff
had received four quotes. See Attachment A. The lowest competitive quote was All Star
Maintenance Incorporated.

The proposed expenditure for the Municipal Complex will be expended from Account No 01-30-
4223 and Account No 10-75-4227 for the Heritage Center. The total estimated costs for all snow
related operations are estimated to be approximately $11,500.00 pending weather events. See
Attachment A, All Star Maintenance has provided satisfactory snow plowing services for the
City in the past.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION

The Staff recommends approval of the resolution accepting a proposal from All Star
Maintenance Incorporated to provide snow plowing and deicing services for the parking lot and
walkways at the Darien Heritage Center and the sidewalk plowing and de-icing services at the
Municipal Complex as per the unit prices

ALTERNATE CONSIDERATION

As directed by the Municipal Services Committee.

DECISION MODE

This item will be placed on the November 5, 2012 City Council agenda for formal approval.




$0Ag Buimold moug £1-Z10Z - V uoenvUenejuswnaog Buiioddngizy 0z 22 1aqoioowsepuaby SYIOM 2liand:d

00°0SZ°IT S| 00°SZI'ST S| 00°SLEYZ  $ | 0000ST'IZ S| 00°00S°LT  $ | 00000S°TT S JJBWHSY 150)) AlIRa ) Ej0],
00°052°6 $ | 00°0SL'S S100SLS'TT ) 00°ST9°01 S| 00°0SL'S $ | 000879 ) [EI0L qng
00°S29'¥ $1005.8°C $ | 00°SLEY $ | 00°000°S $ | 00°000°¢ $ | 00°005°C $ | ST
00°5T9°Y $ | 00°SL8'T $ | 00°005°L $ 1 00°5T9°¢ $ | 00°0SLE $ | 00°0SL°E $ ] 8¢
LTTP-SL-0F YUN0IY-I9U)) IBLILIDH
00°000°CT  $ | 00°SLE'6 $ ] 0000571 S| 0057901 $| 000SL'S $ | 00°0ST°S $ [e101, qng
00°000°9 $ | 00°08L°E $ | 00°000°S $ | 00°000°S $ | 00°000°S $ | 000051 $15¢
00'000°9 § | 00°T9°C $ | 00°005°L $ | 00°€Cos $ | 00°0SL°E $ | 00°05L°E $ | sc
€ZTH-0€-10 unody-juauaedeaq ad1jod pue [leH A1)
201 79 durdeaspuey | spuomeasoxdu] | sjmoudAcadul] | SHUdWAA0IdIIY |  3IBUIUIBIA sorouenba. g posodoag
moug Ajaaaag | syBQ [BAOY AUOURIA] JUOIIHBIA U0 UBIA] 18IS [TV
SLSOD ANV ALLINVNO aaSOd40dd
00°0LE § | 00°0£T $ 1 00°SLy $ | 00°SZF $ | 00°05E § | 00°0ST $ 51800) [B}00L
00°681 ${00°STT $ | 00°SLT $ | 00002 $ | 00°00T $ | 007001 $ JUSAT JAJ-[BMAPIS pue 10T SuPjed Jo Sulj[eg
00°S81 $| 0061 $ | 00°00€ $ | 00°62T $ ] 00051 $ | 00°0S1 $ JUAAY Jad-SUTIEa[) N[EMAPIS PUB 10T BUDHE
13)U3)) IdeILIH
00°08¥ $ | 00°SLE $ | 007005 $ | o0°sTy $ | 00°0S€E $ | 00°01T $ §)800) [EMO ],
00°0¥Z $ 1 00081 $ | 00°00T § | 0000T $ | 00°002 § | 0009 $ JUSAH J9d-}[EMIPIS JO FUL[ES
00'0¥vC $ | 00°5TT $ | 00°00€ $ | 00°522 $ | 00051 § | 00'051 $ JU2AY Jad-3ULIBI[]) H[eMIpIS
juaunpaedea( 2210 pue [[BH AND
] durdeaspue -m.M:m_uu_._.Ma wiwuww.“mg y Mvuuw.”.uma ERLEILT T A wonduisaq
moug farag | SO redod AWM YT, UM AT, A 9L sy o

HAINTD HIOVLITAH ANV TIVH ALID SHOIAYHES ONIMO'Td MONS

V Jusmyaeny




RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING A PROPOSAL FROM ALL STAR MAINTENANCE
INCORPORATED TO PROVIDE SNOW PLOWING AND DEICING SERVICES FOR
THE PARKING LOT AND WALKWAYS AT THE DARIEN HERITAGE CENTER AND
THE SIDEWALK PLOWING AND DEICING SERVICES AT THE MUNICIPAL
COMPLEX AT THE PROPOSED SCHEDULE OF PRICES THROUGH APRIL 30, 2013

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU
PAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS, as follows:

SECTION 1: The City Council of the City of Darien hereby accepts a proposal from All
Star Maintenance Incorporated at the proposed schedule of prices to provide snow plowing and
deicing services for the parking lot and walkways at the Darien Heritage Center and the sidewalk
plowing and deicing services at the Municipal Complex through April 30, 2013, attached hereto
as “Exhibit A”.

SECTION 2: This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage
and approval as provided by law.

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE
COUNTY, ILLINOIS, this 5" day of November, 2012.

AYES:
NAYS:
ABSENT:

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF DARIEN, DU PAGE COUNTY,
ILLINOIS, this 5" day of November, 2012.

KATHLEEN MOESLE WEAVER, MAYOR

ATTEST:

JOANNE E. RAGONA, CITY CLERK

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

CITY ATTORNEY




/T

2012/13 Snow Removal & Salting Services
Page 2 ) L

City Hall and Police Departinent

Sidewalk clearing (per event)

~Silting of sidewalks (per event)

City-of Diarien will provide the salt

“City of Darfen will be responsible for plowing of parking lot

CITY OF DARIEN

Exhibit A

Hetitape Center
Parkirig lot & sidewa}k'clearing (per event) $_ 7S5 o
Parking lot & sidewalk salting {per gvent) S Ay Ay
Contractor to provide salt
Total Costs. 3
Quotes due by Wednesday, October 17,2012 at 11:00 a.m.
Contracior
Provides equipment & labor
Insurance
Proposal good through April 30, 2013
Submitted by: i’ S me %JAX

S T p 2
Contract Name Date _
Address Office Number
Wﬁ)'g‘:h».){/ Lol BeyT S ZBot-E pe

E-mail address

“HD¥d

Cell phone mumber

WY SO:TT

gT027LT173D0




MINUTES
CITY OF DARIEN
MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE
September 24, 2012

PRESENT: Joseph Marchese — Chairperson, Alderman Ted Schauer, Alderman Halil Aveci,
Dan Gombac - Director

ABSENT: None.

ESTABLISH QUORUM

Chairperson Marchese called the meeting to order at 6:30 p.m. at the City Hall — City Council
Chambers, Darien, Illinois and declared a quorum present,

NEW BUSINESS

A. Ordinance — Petitioner seeks a variation to reduce the required front yard building
setback from 45 feet to 30 feet in order to construct a new single-family home.

Mr. Dan Gombac — Director reported that the property is located at 610 67" Street in the Mayada

Brook Subdivision. He reported that the petitioners are seeking a variation to reduce the front

yard building setback in order to construct a new home. He further reported that the PZC held a

public hearing and approved the request 7-0.

Chairperson Marchese questioned if there were any residents at the public hearing.

Mr. Gombac reported that the adjacent resident was present but that she had no concerns with the

request but had comments regarding the addresses being noted through the post office as
Willowbrook versus Darien.

There was no one in the audience wishing to present public comment.

Alderman Schauer made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Avci that based upon
the submitted petition and the information presemted, the request associated with PZC
2012-12 is in conformance with the standards of the Darien City Code and move that the
Municipal Services Committee recommend approval of the petition as presented.

Upon veice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.

Chairperson Marchese announced that this would be placed on the Consent Agenda for the City
Council Meeting on October 1, 2012,

B. Discussion - Proposed adoption of updated editions model building codes.

Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that every six to eight years the building codes need to be
amended. He reported that the City’s consultant, Don Morris Architects P.C. who provides the
City with building plan reviews and building inspections was present.




Mr. Gombac and representatives from Don Morris Architects, P.C. discussed the changes and
updates.

There was discussion concerning the significant change to the model Residential Code including
requiring new single-family detached homes to be fire sprinkled. Mr. Gombac reported that the
draft ordinance includes a local amendment removing this requirement.

Mr. Gombac reported that the fire districts serving Darien were notified of the proposed model
codes as well as the proposed local amendments. He reported that approximately sixty
communities have implemented fire sprinklers.

There was some discussion on the pros and cons of fire sprinklers.

Alderman Schauer questioned the cost versus safety benefit.

Chairperson Marchese stated that he liked the idea of fire suppression.

Alderman Avci questioned if the City if legally liable if a Code is not put in place.
Mr. Gombac stated that he would discuss with the City’s attorney.

Alderman Schauer stated that he was concerned that requiring sprinklers may have a negative
impact to those wanting to improve their homes. He stated that he was not in favor of sprinklers.

Mr. Gombac informed the Commitiee that this item will be brought back in October as a 2™
discussion topic and further items will be clarified.

Mr. Gombac reported on concerns regarding the parking lot widths. He reported that several
requests over the years have been for 9 ft. versus the required 10 fi. He further reported that
many surrounding municipalities require 9 ft.

Chairperson Marchese and Alderman Schauver both recommended changing to 9 ft. parking lot
width.

Mr. Gombac informed the Committee that this item will require a public hearing and will be
scheduled at near future date with the Planning and Zoning Commission.

C. Resolution — Authorizing the Mayor and City Clerk to Execute an
Intergovernmental Agreement with Center Cass School District #66 for the
reimbursement of Rock Salt through the City’s 2012 Rock Salt Agreement with
North American Salt Company.

Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that approval of the resolution authorizes the execution of
the Intergovernmental Agreement for the reimbursement of rock salt. He reported that the
quantity is the same as last year.

There was no one in the audience wishing to present public comment.

MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE September 24, 2012
Page 2




Alderman Avci made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Schauer to approve A
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND THE CITY CLERK TO EXECUTE
AN INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF DARIEN
AND CENTER CASS SCHOOL DISTRICT #66 FOR ROCK SALT.

Upon voice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.

D. Resolution — Awuthorizing the Mayor and City Clerk to Execute an
Intergovernmental Agreement with the Darien Park District for the reimbursement
of Rock Salt through the City’s 2012 Rock Salt Agreement with North American
Salt Company.

Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that approval of the resolution authorizes the execution of
the Intergovernmental Agreement for the reimbursement of rock salt. He reported that the
quantity is the same as last year.

There was no one in the audience wishing to present public comment.

Alderman Avci made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Schauer to approve A
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND THE CITY CLERK TO EXECUTE
AN INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF DARIEN
AND THE DARIEN PARK DISTRICT FOR ROCK SALT.

Upon voice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.

E. Resolution — Accepting a proposal from Grate Signs Inc. for the fabrication and
installation of two breakaway monument signs in an amount not to exceed
$19,200.00 for the City’s Entrance Signs.

Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that the County informed the City staff in August that the
signs on Cass Avenue north of Frontage Road and Lemont Road north of Frontage Road/Cheese
Road and Lemont Road northbound are under the jurisdiction of the Illinois Department of
Transportation and that the signs did not meet specified breakaway materials and hardware.

Mr. Gombac provided photos of the proposed breakaway signs to the Committee. He reported
that the two breakaway signs were more expensive than the recently approved signs and that the
entire sign project would still be within budget.

There was no one in the audience wishing to present public comment.

Alderman Schauer made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Avci to approve A
RESOLUTION ACCEPTING A PROPOSAL FROM GRATE SIGNS INC. FOR THE
FABRICATION AND INSTALLATION OF TWO BREAKAWY MONUMENT SIGNS
IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $19,200.00 FOR THE CITY’S ENTRANCE SIGNS.

Upon voice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.

MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE September 24, 2012
Page 3




F. Resolution — Accepting the unit price proposal from the TLC Group Ltd. for the
purchase and installation of the 50/50 Parkway Tree Program and the planting of
various parkway trees in an amount not to exceed $12,246.80.

Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that approval of the resolution authorizes the execution of
the Intergovernmental Agreement accepting the unit price proposal from TLC Group Ltd. for the
purchase and installation of the 50/50 Parkway Tree Program and the planting of various
parkway trees in an amount not to exceed $12,246.80.

Mr. Gombac stated that the final pricing could change prior to City Council approval as staff was
waiting for residents to respond.

There was no one in the audience wishing to present public comment.

Alderman Schauer made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Avci to approve A
RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE UNIT PRICE PROPOSAL FROM THE TLC GROUP
FOR THE PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF TREES FOR THE 50/50 PARKWAY
TREE PROGRAM AND THE PLANTING OF VARIOUS PARKWAY TREES IN AN
AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $12,246.80.

Upon voice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.

G. Motion — Authorizing City staff to begin the process of accepting a future Plat of
Dedication for Lemont Road cul-de-sac with the Darien Corporate Center
Association.

Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that the Darien Corporate Center Association has requested

that the City take ownership of the Lemont Road cul-de-sac roadway. He reported that

Association will be responsible for the proposed improvements, including engineering and legal

as presented within the agenda memo.
Alderman Avci questioned if there were any issues with consent.

Mr. Gombac reported that all owners were in support and that he has email confirmation.

Alderman Avci questioned if this was the first time the City has taken over from a business
association.

Chairperson Marchese stated that the parameters were set by the City approximately 6 or 7 years
ago.

Chairperson Marchese questioned snow removal.
Mr. Gombac confirmed Alderman Avcei’s inquiry that the proposed street dedication was the first

business property. The snow removal would not be a concern and provisions for utilizing the
existing apron would be recorded on the plat.

MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE September 24, 2012
Page 4




Mr. Stan Widlacki and Sharon Cattaneo were in the audience representing the Darien Corporate
Center Association.

Alderman Avci made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Schauer to accept the
preliminary Plat of Dedication for the Lemont Road roadway within the Darien Corporate

Center Development subject to the conditions outlined in the September 24, 2012 agenda
memo.

Upon voice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.
H. Minutes — Approval of the July 23, 2012 Municipal Services Committce Regular

Meeting Minutes and the August 20, 2012 Municipal Services Committee Special
Meeting Minutes.

Alderman Avei made a motion, and it was seconded by Alderman Schauer to approve the
July 23, 2012 Municipal Services Committee Regular Meeting Minutes and the August 20,
2012 Municipal Services Commitiee Special Meeting Minutes.
Upon voice vote, THE MOTION CARRIED unanimously 3-0.

DIRECTOR’S REPORT

a. Emerald Ash Borer Information
Mr. Dan Gombac, Director reported that staff feels that the application is not urgent. He
reported that the application process will be done in April or May.

Chairperson Marchese reported that he received correspondence from a resident in the Villas of
Carriage Greens regarding speeding and traffic on Evergreen.

Mr. Gombac reported that he would contact the resident to discuss a traffic study.
NEXT SCHEDULED MEETING

Chairperson Marchese announced that the next regularly scheduled meeting will be held on
Monday, October 22, 2012.

ADJOURNMENT

With no further business before the Committee, Alderman Schauer made a motion and it
was seconded by Alderman Marchese to adjourn. Upon voice vote, THE MOTION
CARRIED unanimously and the meeting adjourned at 8:40 p.m.

MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE September 24, 2012
Page 5




RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED:

Elizabeth Lahey
Secretary

Halil Avci
Alderman

MUNICIPAL SERVICES COMMITTEE
Page 6

Joseph Marchese
Chairman

Ted Schauer
Alderman

September 24, 2012






